

**SCHOOL BOARD OF BREVARD COUNTY, FLORIDA**

**BOARD AGENDA ITEM – September 8, 2022**

**PROCUREMENT SOLICITATION**

**ITB 22-934-B-WH – Diesel, Gasoline & Fuel Oil**

<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <b>(ITB)</b> Invitation To Bid	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(ITN)</b> Invitation To Negotiate	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(PB)</b> Piggyback
<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(RFP)</b> Request For Proposal	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(RFQ)</b> Request For Qualifications	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(SC)</b> State Contract
<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(SS)</b> Sole Source		

**REQUESTOR:** Transportation

**Legal Review Required:**  Yes  No

**Standard Template Used with No Changes:**  Yes  No

**Standard Template Type:** Invitation to Bid

VENDOR NAME	AMOUNT AWARDED	REQUIRED PRODUCTS/SERVICES
Glover Oil Company, Inc.	Variable - Based Upon Usage and OPIS Index Pricing	Items 1B, 1C, 2B, 2C, 3B, 3C, 4B, 4C, 5B, 5C, 6B, 6C, 7A, 7B, 7C, 8A, 8B, 8C
Palmdale Oil Company, Inc.	Variable – Based Upon Usage and OPIS Index Pricing	Items 1A, 2A, 3A, 4A, 5A, 6A
<b>Total</b>	Variable	

<input type="checkbox"/> <b>Contract Renewal</b>	<b>New Contract Amount</b>	Variable
<input type="checkbox"/> <b>Recurring Contract</b>	<b>Previous Annual Contract Amount</b>	\$1,700,000.00
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <b>New Contract</b>	<b>Variance</b>	N/A

**PRICE INCREASE / DECREASE EXPLANATION:** N/A

**DISCUSSION:**

This solicitation represents a cooperative procurement for the Brevard County Public Entity Purchasing Cooperative, in which the School Board of Brevard County is the lead agency. Local governmental entities within the Brevard County area, currently consisting of approximately 8 members, have entered an Interlocal Agreement to create a cooperative purchasing group within our geographical area. The Cooperative was formed in an effort to develop collaborative relationships among its participants for the purpose of seeking responses to solicitations which may result in lower costs to group participants on commonly used commodities, better quality of products, and lower administrative costs. Only members of the Cooperative are permitted to utilize this solicitation. The purpose of this invitation to bid is to provide firm markups/discounts per gallon for various fuels based on the Oil Price Information Services (OPIS) average daily price index for the Transportation Department and other agencies that are members for the Cooperative.

The standard Invitation to Bid template has been used, which does not require legal review.

**CONTRACT TERM:**

The initial contract term shall commence September 9, 2022 and continue until September 8, 2025 with an optional one (1) two (2) year renewal period.

**RECOMMENDATION:**

It is the recommendation of Mr. Rachad T. Wilson, Chief Operating Officer, and Dr. Michael Miller, Director of Transportation Services to award the above solicitation to Glover Oil Company, Inc. and Palmdale Oil Company, Inc. in the amount of Variable.

**AUTHORITY FOR ACTION:**

Florida Administrative Code 6A-1.012 (9)

**School Board of Brevard County**  
**Office of Procurement & Distribution Services**  
2700 Judge Fran Jamieson Way  
Viera, FL 32940-6601  
**Mark W. Mullins, Ed.D., Superintendent**



**August 24, 2022**

**NOTICE OF INTENDED DECISION**  
**Solicitation # 22-934-B-WH**  
**Diesel, Gasoline, and Fuel Oil**  
Brevard County Public Entity Cooperative

The Office of Procurement Services hereby notifies all firms of an intended decision regarding the award of the above-mentioned solicitation as outlined on the attached Bid Tabulation.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section [120.57](#)(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

Please contact Wil Henzmann, Senior Procurement Agent at 321-633-1000 ext. 11623 or by email at [henzmann.william@brevardschools.org](mailto:henzmann.william@brevardschools.org) if you should have any questions. Thank you for your continued interest in The School Board of Brevard County, Florida.

Sincerely,

 Digitally signed by  
Rodriguez.Kristine@Procurement  
and Distribution Services  
Date: 2022.08.24 12:16:17 -04'00'

Kristine Rodriguez, MBA, NIGP-CPP, CPPO, CPPB  
Director of Procurement and Distribution Services

*Office of Procurement & Distribution Services*  
*Phone: (321) 633-1000 Ext. 11645 · FAX: (321) 877-0904*  
*Distribution: (321) 633-3680 Ext. 14100 ▪ FAX: (321) 633-3698*

<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB #2-934-B-WH</b> Diesel, Gasoline and Fuel Oil August 15, 2022 at 2:00 PM Opened By: Dawn D. Richer, Procurement Manager This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval September 8, 2022  Date Solicited: July 20, 2022 Date Opened: August 15, 2022 # Solicited: 214		<b>Glover Oil Company, Inc.</b> 3109 S. Main Street Melbourne, FL 32901 321.723.3953 Ken Marshall ken@gloveroil.com					<b>Palmdale Oil Company, Inc.</b> 911 N. 2nd Street Ft. Pierce, FL 34950 772.595.0843 Lachlan Cheatham lach@palmdaleoil.com				
Item #	Description of Items	Estimated Qty to be used in determining bid award	Firm Markup or Discount Per Gallon (+/-) to be Applied to OPIS Average	DAILY OPIS 7/1/22	Net Price (OPIS + markup)	Extended Price (Qty X Net Price)	Estimated Qty to be used in determining bid award	Firm Markup or Discount Per Gallon (+/-) to be Applied to OPIS Average	DAILY OPIS 7/1/22	Net Price (OPIS + markup)	Extended Price (Qty X Net Price)
1A	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Transport Tanker Delivery	3,500	\$0.0055	\$4.1422	\$4.1477	\$14,516.9500	3,500	-\$0.0478	\$4.1422	\$4.0944	\$14,330.4000
1B	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	3,500	\$0.0895	\$4.1422	\$4.2317	\$14,810.9500	3,500	\$0.1729	\$4.1422	\$4.3151	\$15,102.8500
1C	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Tank Wagon Delivery - No Minimum	3,500	\$0.0995	\$4.1422	\$4.2417	\$14,845.9500	3,500	\$0.1729	\$4.1422	\$4.3151	\$15,102.8500
2A	Gasoline, Mid-Grade Unleaded 89 Transport Tanker Delivery	1,000	\$0.0055	\$3.7045	\$3.7100	\$3,710.0000	1,000	-\$0.0027	\$3.7045	\$3.7018	\$3,701.8000
2B	Gasoline, Mid-Grade Unleaded 89 Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	1,000	\$0.0199	\$3.7045	\$3.7244	\$3,724.4000	1,000	\$0.1729	\$3.7045	\$3.8774	\$3,877.4000
2C	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 89 Tank Wagon Delivery - No Minimum	1,000	\$0.0399	\$3.7045	\$3.7444	\$3,744.4000	1,000	\$0.1729	\$3.7045	\$3.8774	\$3,877.4000
3A	Gasoline, Regular Unleaded 87 Transport Tanker Delivery	1,719,800	\$0.0295	\$3.4646	\$3.4941	\$6,009,153.1800	1,719,800	\$0.0085	\$3.4646	\$3.4731	\$5,973,037.3800
3B	Gasoline, Regular Unleaded 87 Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	1,719,800	\$0.1295	\$3.4646	\$3.5941	\$6,181,133.1800	1,719,800	\$0.1729	\$3.4646	\$3.6375	\$6,255,772.5000
3C	Gasoline, Regular Unleaded 87 Tank Wagon Delivery - No Minimum	1,719,800	\$0.1495	\$3.4646	\$3.6141	\$6,215,529.1800	1,719,800	\$0.1729	\$3.4646	\$3.6375	\$6,255,772.5000
4A	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Octane Non-Ethanol Transport Tanker Delivery	1,000	\$0.0001	\$4.3788	\$4.3789	\$4,378.9000	1,000	-\$0.0478	\$4.3788	\$4.3310	\$4,331.0000
4B	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Octane Non-Ethanol Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	1,000	\$0.1295	\$4.3788	\$4.5083	\$4,508.3000	1,000	\$0.1729	\$4.3788	\$4.5517	\$4,551.7000
4C	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Octane Non-Ethanol Tank Wagon Delivery - No Minimum	1,000	\$0.1495	\$4.3788	\$4.5283	\$4,528.3000	1,000	\$0.1729	\$4.3788	\$4.5517	\$4,551.7000
5A	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur - Red Dye Transport Tanker Delivery	186,000	\$0.0295	\$4.2910	\$4.3205	\$803,613.0000	186,000	\$0.0197	\$4.2910	\$4.3107	\$801,790.2000
5B	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur - Red Dye Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	186,000	\$0.1295	\$4.2910	\$4.4205	\$822,213.0000	186,000	\$0.1729	\$4.2910	\$4.4639	\$830,285.4000
5C	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur - Red Dye Tank Wagon Delivery - No Minimum	186,000	\$0.1495	\$4.2910	\$4.4405	\$825,933.0000	186,000	\$0.1729	\$4.2910	\$4.4639	\$830,285.4000
6A	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur Transport Tanker Delivery	1,976,000	\$0.0295	\$4.2927	\$4.3222	\$8,540,667.2000	1,976,000	\$0.0147	\$4.2927	\$4.3074	\$8,511,422.4000
6B	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	1,976,000	\$0.1295	\$4.2927	\$4.4222	\$8,738,267.2000	1,976,000	\$0.1729	\$4.2927	\$4.4656	\$8,824,025.6000
6C	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur Tank Wagon Delivery - No Minimum	1,976,000	\$0.1495	\$4.2927	\$4.4422	\$8,777,787.2000	1,976,000	\$0.1729	\$4.2927	\$4.4656	\$8,824,025.6000
7A	Biodiesel, B-20 Transport Tanker Delivery	50,000	\$0.0200	\$4.2800	\$4.3000	\$215,000.0000	50,000	\$0.0565	\$4.2800	\$4.3365	\$216,825.0000
7B	Biodiesel, B-20 Blend Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	50,000	\$0.1295	\$4.2800	\$4.4095	\$220,475.0000	50,000	\$0.1729	\$4.2800	\$4.4529	\$222,645.0000
7C	Biodiesel, B-20 Blend Tank Wagon Delivery - No Minimum	50,000	\$0.1495	\$4.2800	\$4.4295	\$221,475.0000	50,000	\$0.1729	\$4.2800	\$4.4529	\$222,645.0000
8A	Biodiesel, B-5 Blend Transport Tanker Delivery	50,000	\$0.0295	\$4.2875	\$4.3170	\$215,850.0000	50,000	\$0.0565	\$4.2875	\$4.3440	\$217,200.0000
8B	Biodiesel, B-5 Blend Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	50,000	\$0.1395	\$4.2875	\$4.4270	\$221,350.0000	50,000	\$0.1729	\$4.2875	\$4.4604	\$223,020.0000
8C	Biodiesel, B-5 Blend Tank Wagon Delivery - No Minimum	50,000	\$0.1495	\$4.2875	\$4.4370	\$221,850.0000	50,000	\$0.1729	\$4.2875	\$4.4604	\$223,020.0000
9	Wet Hose Fueling (pump from the truck and directly into the buses)					\$0.2599					\$0.3500
10	Off Road Wet Hose Fueling (pump from the truck and directly into off road equipment)					\$0.2799					\$0.4000
11	Percentage Mark Up for purchases made with purchasing card. (Percentage will be applied to total cost of individual purchases paid with p-card)					2.70%					2.50%
12	EMERGENCY PLANNING Daily cost of portable storage tank (each)					\$50.00					\$25.00
13	BRAND NAMES OF FUELS	Vitol, Sunoco, Marathon, TAC Energy, Motiva, Atlas					Marathon, Valero, Chevron, Vitol				

**Recommended Award Key: Columns highlighted in yellow identify the recommended award.**

<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB #2-934-B-WH</b> <b>Diesel, Gasoline and Fuel Oil</b> <b>August 15, 2022 at 2:00 PM</b> <b>Opened By: Dawn D. Richer, Procurement Manager</b> <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending</b> <b>Board Approval September 8, 2022</b>		<b>Colonial Oil Industries, Inc.</b> <b>101 North Lathrop Avenue</b> <b>Savannah, GA 31415</b> <b>Adam Barnett</b> <b>912.443.6590 x3252</b> <b>coisales@colonialoil.com</b>					<b>Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc.</b> <b>1025 Airport Pkwy</b> <b>Gainesville, GA 30501</b> <b>678.450.2000</b> <b>mocbids@mansfieldoil.com</b>				
Item #	Description of Items	Estimated Qty to be used in determining bid award	Firm Markup or Discount Per Gallon (+/-) to be Applied to OPIS Average	DAILY OPIS 7/1/22	Net Price (OPIS + markup)	Extended Price (Qty X Net Price)	Estimated Qty to be used in determining bid award	Firm Markup or Discount Per Gallon (+/-) to be Applied to OPIS Average	DAILY OPIS 7/1/22	Net Price (OPIS + markup)	Extended Price (Qty X Net Price)
1A	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Transport Tanker Delivery	3,500	\$0.1368	\$4.1422	\$4.2790	\$14,976.5000	3,500	No Bid	\$4.1422		
1B	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	3,500	No Bid	\$4.1422			3,500	No Bid	\$4.1422		
1C	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Tank Wagon Delivery – No Minimum	3,500	No Bid	\$4.1422			3,500	No Bid	\$4.1422		
2A	Gasoline, Mid-Grade Unleaded 89 Transport Tanker Delivery	1,000	\$0.1368	\$3.7045	\$3.8413	\$3,841.3000	1,000	No Bid	\$3.7045		
2B	Gasoline, Mid-Grade Unleaded 89 Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	1,000	No Bid	\$3.7045			1,000	No Bid	\$3.7045		
2C	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 89 Tank Wagon Delivery – No Minimum	1,000	No Bid	\$3.7045			1,000	No Bid	\$3.7045		
3A	Gasoline, Regular Unleaded 87 Transport Tanker Delivery	1,719,800	\$0.0793	\$3.4646	\$3.5439	\$6,094,799.2200	1,719,800	\$0.0480	\$3.4646	\$3.5126	\$6,040,969.4800
3B	Gasoline, Regular Unleaded 87 Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	1,719,800	No Bid	\$3.4646			1,719,800	No Bid	\$3.4646		
3C	Gasoline, Regular Unleaded 87 Tank Wagon Delivery – No Minimum	1,719,800	No Bid	\$3.4646			1,719,800	No Bid	\$3.4646		
4A	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Octane Non-Ethanol Transport Tanker Delivery	1,000	\$0.1568	\$4.3788	\$4.5356	\$4,535.6000	1,000	No Bid	\$4.3788		
4B	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Octane Non-Ethanol Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	1,000	No Bid	\$4.3788			1,000	No Bid	\$4.3788		
4C	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Octane Non-Ethanol Tank Wagon Delivery – No Minimum	1,000	No Bid	\$4.3788			1,000	No Bid	\$4.3788		
5A	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur – Red Dye Transport Tanker Delivery	186,000	\$0.0928	\$4.2910	\$4.3838	\$815,386.8000	186,000	\$0.0730	\$4.2910	\$4.3640	\$811,704.0000
5B	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur – Red Dye Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	186,000	No Bid	\$4.2910			186,000	No Bid	\$4.2910		
5C	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur – Red Dye Tank Wagon Delivery - No Minimum	186,000	No Bid	\$4.2910			186,000	No Bid	\$4.2910		
6A	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur Transport Tanker Delivery	1,976,000	\$0.0878	\$4.2927	\$4.3805	\$8,655,868.0000	1,976,000	\$0.0532	\$4.2927	\$4.3459	\$8,587,498.4000
6B	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	1,976,000	No Bid	\$4.2927			1,976,000	No Bid	\$4.2927		
6C	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur Tank Wagon Delivery - No Minimum	1,976,000	No Bid	\$4.2927			1,976,000	No Bid	\$4.2927		
7A	Biodiesel, B-20 Transport Tanker Delivery	50,000	\$0.1478	\$4.2800	\$4.4278	\$221,390.0000	50,000	No Bid	\$4.2800		
7B	Biodiesel, B-20 Blend Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	50,000	No Bid	\$4.2800			50,000	No Bid	\$4.2800		
7C	Biodiesel, B-20 Blend Tank Wagon Delivery – No Minimum	50,000	No Bid	\$4.2800			50,000	No Bid	\$4.2800		
8A	Biodiesel, B-5 Blend Transport Tanker Delivery	50,000	\$0.1478	\$4.2875	\$4.4353	\$221,765.0000	50,000	No Bid	\$4.2875		
8B	Biodiesel, B-5 Blend Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	50,000	No Bid	\$4.2875			50,000	No Bid	\$4.2875		
8C	Biodiesel, B-5 Blend Tank Wagon Delivery – No Minimum	50,000	No Bid	\$4.2875			50,000	No Bid	\$4.2875		
9	Wet Hose Fueling (pump from the truck and directly into the buses)					\$600.0000					No Bid
10	Off Road Wet Hose Fueling (pump from the truck and directly into off road equipment)					\$650.0000					No Bid
11	Percentage Mark Up for purchases made with purchasing card. (Percentage will be applied to total cost of individual purchases paid with p-card)					No P-Card Accepted					No Bid
12	EMERGENCY PLANNING Daily cost of portable storage tank (each)					\$2,250.0000					No Bid
13	BRAND NAMES OF FUELS										Motiva Various

<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB #2-934-B-WH</b> Diesel, Gasoline and Fuel Oil August 15, 2022 at 2:00 PM Opened By: Dawn D. Richer, Procurement Manager This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval September 8, 2022		<b>Saratoga Rack Marketing, LLC (Pilot Travel Centers, LLC)</b> 5508 Lonas Drive Knoxville, TN 37909 865.410.4384 Josh Epperson govbiz@saratograrack.com					<b>SSI Lubricants</b> 5131 Recker Highway Winter Haven, FL 33880 877.811.3835 Patricia Arruza admin@ssipetro.com				
Item #	Description of Items	Estimated Qty to be used in determining bid award	Firm Markup or Discount Per Gallon (+/-) to be Applied to OPIS Average	DAILY OPIS 7/1/22	Net Price (OPIS + markup)	Extended Price (Qty X Net Price)	Estimated Qty to be used in determining bid award	Firm Markup or Discount Per Gallon (+/-) to be Applied to OPIS Average	DAILY OPIS 7/1/22	Net Price (OPIS + markup)	Extended Price (Qty X Net Price)
1A	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Transport Tanker Delivery	3,500	\$0.0723	\$4.1422	\$4.2145	\$14,750.7500	3,500	\$0.0650	\$4.1422	\$4.2072	\$14,725.2000
1B	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	3,500	No Bid	\$4.1422			3,500	\$0.3700	\$4.1422	\$4.5122	\$15,792.7000
1C	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Tank Wagon Delivery – No Minimum	3,500	No Bid	\$4.1422			3,500	\$0.4500	\$4.1422	\$4.5922	\$16,072.7000
2A	Gasoline, Mid-Grade Unleaded 89 Transport Tanker Delivery	1,000	\$0.0723	\$3.7045	\$3.7768	\$3,776.8000	1,000	\$0.0650	\$3.7045	\$3.7695	\$3,769.5000
2B	Gasoline, Mid-Grade Unleaded 89 Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	1,000	No Bid	\$3.7045			1,000	\$0.3700	\$3.7045	\$4.0745	\$4,074.5000
2C	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 89 Tank Wagon Delivery – No Minimum	1,000	No Bid	\$3.7045			1,000	\$0.4500	\$3.7045	\$4.1545	\$4,154.5000
3A	Gasoline, Regular Unleaded 87 Transport Tanker Delivery	1,719,800	\$0.0723	\$3.4646	\$3.5369	\$6,082,760.6200	1,719,800	\$0.0650	\$3.4646	\$3.5296	\$6,070,206.0800
3B	Gasoline, Regular Unleaded 87 Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	1,719,800	No Bid	\$3.4646			1,719,800	\$0.3700	\$3.4646	\$3.8346	\$6,594,745.0800
3C	Gasoline, Regular Unleaded 87 Tank Wagon Delivery – No Minimum	1,719,800	No Bid	\$3.4646			1,719,800	\$0.4500	\$3.4646	\$3.9146	\$6,732,329.0800
4A	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Octane Non-Ethanol Transport Tanker Delivery	1,000	No Bid	\$4.3788			1,000	\$0.0725	\$4.3788	\$4.4513	\$4,451.3000
4B	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Octane Non-Ethanol Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	1,000	No Bid	\$4.3788			1,000	\$0.3725	\$4.3788	\$4.7513	\$4,751.3000
4C	Gasoline, Premium Unleaded 93 Octane Non-Ethanol Tank Wagon Delivery – No Minimum	1,000	No Bid	\$4.3788			1,000	\$0.4525	\$4.3788	\$4.8313	\$4,831.3000
5A	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur – Red Dye Transport Tanker Delivery	186,000	\$0.0200	\$4.2910	\$4.3110	\$801,846.0000	186,000	\$0.0550	\$4.2910	\$4.3460	\$808,356.0000
5B	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur – Red Dye Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	186,000	No Bid	\$4.2910			186,000	\$0.3500	\$4.2910	\$4.6410	\$863,226.0000
5C	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur – Red Dye Tank Wagon Delivery - No Minimum	186,000	No Bid	\$4.2910			186,000	\$0.4500	\$4.2910	\$4.7410	\$881,826.0000
6A	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur Transport Tanker Delivery	1,976,000	\$0.0261	\$4.2927	\$4.3188	\$8,533,948.8000	1,976,000	\$0.0550	\$4.2927	\$4.3477	\$8,591,055.2000
6B	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	1,976,000	No Bid	\$4.2927			1,976,000	\$0.3500	\$4.2927	\$4.6427	\$9,173,975.2000
6C	Diesel #2, Ultra Low Sulfur Tank Wagon Delivery - No Minimum	1,976,000	No Bid	\$4.2927			1,976,000	\$0.4300	\$4.2927	\$4.7227	\$9,332,055.2000
7A	Biodiesel, B-20 Transport Tanker Delivery	50,000	No Bid	\$4.2800			50,000	No Bid	\$4.2800		
7B	Biodiesel, B-20 Blend Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	50,000	No Bid	\$4.2800			50,000	No Bid	\$4.2800		
7C	Biodiesel, B-20 Blend Tank Wagon Delivery – No Minimum	50,000	No Bid	\$4.2800			50,000	No Bid	\$4.2800		
8A	Biodiesel, B-5 Blend Transport Tanker Delivery	50,000	No Bid	\$4.2875			50,000	No Bid	\$4.2875		
8B	Biodiesel, B-5 Blend Tank Wagon Delivery - 500 Gallon Minimum	50,000	No Bid	\$4.2875			50,000	No Bid	\$4.2875		
8C	Biodiesel, B-5 Blend Tank Wagon Delivery – No Minimum	50,000	No Bid	\$4.2875			50,000	No Bid	\$4.2875		
9	Wet Hose Fueling (pump from the truck and directly into the buses)					\$45.0000					\$150.0000
10	Off Road Wet Hose Fueling (pump from the truck and directly into off road equipment)					No Bid					\$150.0000
11	Percentage Mark Up for purchases made with purchasing card. (Percentage will be applied to total cost of individual purchases paid with p-card)					No P-Card Accepted					0.0350
12	EMERGENCY PLANNING Daily cost of portable storage tank (each)					No Bid					\$25.0000
13	BRAND NAMES OF FUELS					ULSD - Vitol; Gas - Buckeye					Marathon