

**SCHOOL BOARD OF BREVARD COUNTY, FLORIDA**

**BOARD AGENDA ITEM – May 12, 2020**

**PROCUREMENT SOLICITATION**

**ITB # 20-710-B-SH: Kitchen Equipment &  
Refrigeration Parts Catalog Bid**

<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <b>(ITB)</b> Invitation To Bid	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(ITN)</b> Invitation To Negotiate	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(PB)</b> Piggyback
<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(RFP)</b> Request For Proposal	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(RFQ)</b> Request For Qualifications	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(SC)</b> State Contract
<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(SS)</b> Sole Source		

**REQUESTOR:** Plant Operations & Maintenance

**Legal Review Required:**  Yes  No

**Standard Template Used with No Changes:**  Yes  No

**Standard Template Type:** Invitation to Bid

VENDOR NAME	AMOUNT AWARDED	REQUIRED PRODUCTS/SERVICES
Noland dba Winsupply Port St. Lucie Parts Town, LLC The Ware Group, LLC dba Johnstone Supply TWC Services, Inc.	Variable	Replacement parts for kitchen and refrigeration equipment
<b>Total</b>	Variable	

<input type="checkbox"/> <b>Contract Renewal</b>	<b>New Contract Amount</b>	Variable
<input type="checkbox"/> <b>Recurring Contract</b>	<b>Previous Contract Amount</b>	Variable
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <b>New Contract</b>	<b>Variance</b>	N/A

**PRICE INCREASE / DECREASE EXPLANATION:** N/A

**DISCUSSION:**

Plant Operations & Maintenance provides preventative maintenance and repairs for all kitchen facilities throughout the District. To perform the required preventative maintenance and repairs, parts and materials are required for various manufacturer brands. The recommended vendors have the resources to provide the necessary parts and materials for the equipment.

The standard Invitation to Bid template has been used, which does not require legal review.

**CONTRACT TERM:**

The initial contract term shall commence May 13, 2020 and continue until May 12, 2023 with one (1) optional two (2) year renewal period.

**RECOMMENDATION:**

It is the recommendation of Susan Hann, Assistant Superintendent of Facilities Services and James Ross, Director of Plant Operations & Maintenance to approve the attached tabulation sheet with the above vendors.

**AUTHORITY FOR ACTION:**

Florida Administrative Code 6A-1.012(9)

<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB # 20-710-B-SH</b> <b>Kitchen Equipment &amp; Refrigeration Parts Catalog Bid</b> <b>April 8, 2020 at 2:00 PM</b> Opened By: Sean Hynes, Buyer II Witnessed By: William Henzmann, CPPB, Senior Buyer <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation</b> <b>pending Board Approval May 12, 2020</b>  <b>Date Solicited: March 6, 2020</b> <b>Date Opened: April 8, 2020</b> <b># Solicited 1715      # MWBE 54</b> <b># Planholders 35    # Submittals 6</b>		Hobart Service Division of ITW Food Equipment Group, LLC 701 S. Ridge Ave., Troy, OH 45373 David Goodchild 407-856-4000 orlandofl.service@hobartservice.com	Noland dba Winsupply Port St. Lucie 8227 Business Park Drive Port St. Lucie, FL 34952 Peter Mitchell 954-290-6138 pmmitchell@winsupplyinc.com	Parts Town, LLC 1200 Greenbriar Drive Addison, IL 6010 Tari Kovets contractservices@hfse.com	The Ware Group, LLC dba Johnstone Supply 11710 Central Parkway Jacksonville, FL 32224 Paul Levesque 813-955-2156 paul.levesque@johnstonewaregroup.com	TWC Services, Inc. 150 Maritime Drive Sanford, FL 32771 Parts Group 407-898-2222 parts@twcservice.com
Completed Bidder's Acknowledgement	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	
FL Dept. of State Division of Corporations Number	N/A	810893	N/A	L08000098969	F03000005740	
Litigations/Bankruptcy	N	N	N	N	N	
Confidential Materials Enclosed	N	N	N	N	N	
Addendum #1	N	Y	Y	Y	Y	
References Form	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	
Local Business Tax Receipts	N/A	Y	Y	Y	Y	
Current W-9	N	Y	Y	Y	Y	
Proof of Insurance	N	Y	Y	Y	Y	
Certified Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Bidder's Statement of Principal Place of Business	N	N/A	Y	N/A	N/A	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION					
1	Anets	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
2	Avttec	No Bid	31.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
3	Beverage Air	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
4	Blakeslee	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	16.00%	
5	Blodgett	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
6	Bloomfield/Silex	No Bid	31.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
7	Bunn	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	33.00%	
8	Carter Hoffman	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
9	Cecilware Corp.	No Bid	31.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
10	Champion Industries	No Bid	23.20%	51.00%	21.00%	
11	Cleveland Range	No Bid	29.60%	51.00%	31.00%	
12	Crystal Tip	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
13	CTX Ovens	No Bid	22.72%	51.00%	16.00%	
14	Curtis	No Bid	31.00%	No Bid	33.00%	
15	Dormont	No Bid	36.00%	No Bid	34.00%	
16	Duke MFG	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	33.00%	
17	Edlund	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
18	Ekco	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
19	Electrolux	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	21.00%	
20	Frymaster	No Bid	29.60%	51.00%	31.00%	
21	Garland	No Bid	29.60%	51.00%	31.00%	
22	Glenco	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
23	Groen	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
24	Hatco	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
25	Hobart	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	No Bid	
26	Hoshizake	No Bid	16.80%	51.00%	12.00%	
27	Int'l Cold Storage	No Bid	31.00%	No Bid	27.00%	
28	Manitowoc	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
29	Market Forge	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
30	Master	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	27.00%	
31	Metro	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
32	Metro Proofer Cabinets	No Bid	36.00%	No Bid	31.00%	
33	Middleby Marshal	No Bid	28.32%	No Bid	21.00%	
34	Precision Mfg. Co.	No Bid	31.00%	No Bid	No Bid	
35	Red Goat	No Bid	10.00%	51.00%	17.00%	
36	Robot Coupe	No Bid	23.20%	51.00%	17.00%	
37	Salvajor	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
38	Seco	No Bid	24.10%	No Bid	31.00%	
39	Southbend	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%	
40	Stero	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	27.00%	
41	T & S Brass	No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%	

Recommended Award Key: Columns highlighted in green identify the recommended award.

All other bidders did not meet the definition of responsive and responsible for this bid as outlined in Section 2.10

<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB # 20-710-B-SH</b> <b>Kitchen Equipment &amp; Refrigeration Parts Catalog Bid</b> <b>April 8, 2020 at 2:00 PM</b> Opened By: Sean Hynes, Buyer II Witnessed By: William Henzmann, CPPB, Senior Buyer <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation</b> <b>pending Board Approval May 12, 2020</b>		<b>Hobart Service</b> <b>Division of ITW Food Equipment Group,</b> <b>LLC</b> 701 S. Ridge Ave., Troy, OH 45373 David Goodchild 407-856-4000 orlandofl.service@hobartservice.com	<b>Noland dba Winsupply Port St. Lucie</b> 8227 Business Park Drive Port St. Lucie, FL 34952 Peter Mitchell 954-290-6138 pmmitchell@winsupplyinc.com	<b>Parts Town, LLC</b> 1200 Greenbriar Drive Addison, IL 6010 Tari Kovets contractservices@hfse.com	<b>The Ware Group, LLC dba Johnstone</b> <b>Supply</b> 11710 Central Parkway Jacksonville, FL 32224 Paul Levesque 813-955-2156 paul.levesque@johnstonewaregroup.com	<b>TWC Services, Inc.</b> 150 Maritime Drive Sanford, FL 32771 Parts Group 407-898-2222 parts@twcservice.com
	<b>Date Solicited: March 6, 2020</b> <b>Date Opened: April 8, 2020</b> <b># Solicitated 1715      # MWBE 54</b> <b># Planholders 35      # Submittals 6</b>					
42	Tabco		No Bid	31.00%	No Bid	No Bid
43	Traulsen		No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	34.00%
44	Univex		No Bid	31.00%	51.00%	27.00%
45	Victory		No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	27.00%
46	Vulcan-Hart		No Bid	16.80%	51.00%	21.00%
47	Waring Commercial/Qualheim		No Bid	31.00%	51.00%	5.00%
48	Wearever		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
49	Wells		No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%
50	Wilder Mfg.		No Bid	31.00%	No Bid	27.00%
51	Winston		No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%
52	Bally		No Bid	10.30%	51.00%	31.00%
53	Bohn		60.00%	31.00%	51.00%	31.00%
54	Delfield		No Bid	29.60%	51.00%	31.00%
55	Federal		No Bid	3.40%	51.00%	31.00%
56	Food Warming Equipment		No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	33.00%
57	Kolpak/Volrath		No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	31.00%
58	Master-Bilt		No Bid	33.44%	51.00%	31.00%
59	Russell		60.00%	No Bid	51.00%	33.00%
60	TRUE		No Bid	36.00%	51.00%	33.00%
61	OEM or Alternate Manufacturer: Heatcraft		60.00%			
62	OEM or Alternate Manufacturer: Chandler		60.00%			
71	Minimum Order Dollar Amount		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
72	Normal Delivery Time in Days		5	5	5	5