

**SCHOOL BOARD OF BREVARD COUNTY, FLORIDA**

**BOARD AGENDA ITEM – March 22, 2022**

**PROCUREMENT SOLICITATION**

**ITB 22-414-B-CC Print Shop Paper and Supplies**

<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <b>(ITB)</b> Invitation To Bid	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(ITN)</b> Invitation To Negotiate	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(PB)</b> Piggyback
<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(RFP)</b> Request For Proposal	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(RFQ)</b> Request For Qualifications	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(SC)</b> State Contract
<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(SS)</b> Sole Source		

**REQUESTOR:** Gov't Community Relations – Print Shop      **Legal Review Required:**  Yes  No  
**Standard Template Used with No Changes:**  Yes  No  
**Standard Template:** ITB

VENDOR NAME	AMOUNT AWARDED	REQUIRED PRODUCTS/SERVICES
Mac Papers Office Depot Sunshine Paper and Office Supplies Agni Enterprises	Variable	Print Shop paper and supplies
<b>Total</b>	Variable	

<input type="checkbox"/> <b>Contract Renewal</b>	<b>New Contract Amount</b>	Variable
<input type="checkbox"/> <b>Recurring Contract</b>	<b>Previous Contract Amount</b>	Variable
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <b>New Contract</b>	<b>Variance</b>	--

**PRICE INCREASE / DECREASE EXPLANATION:** N/A

**DISCUSSION:**

This term contract will be utilized by the print shop for bulk purchases of paper goods and general supplies.

The standard ITB template has been used, which does not require legal review.

**CONTRACT TERM:**

The initial contract term shall commence March 23, 2022 and continue until September 22, 2022, with four (4) optional six (6) month renewal periods.

**RECOMMENDATION:**

It is the recommendation of Russell Bruhn, Assistant Superintendent of Government and Community Relations and Daren Bolton, Manager of Printing Services, to award all of the responsive, responsible bidders as highlighted on the attached tabulation sheet.

**AUTHORITY FOR ACTION:**

Florida Administrative Code 6A-1.012

**School Board of Brevard County**  
**Office of Procurement & Distribution Services**  
2700 Judge Fran Jamieson Way  
Viera, FL 32940-6601  
**Mark W. Mullins, Ed.D., Superintendent**



**March 4, 2022**

**NOTICE OF INTENDED DECISION**  
22-414-B-CC  
Print Shop Paper and Supplies

The Office of Procurement Services hereby notifies all firms of an intended decision regarding the award of the above-mentioned solicitation as outlined attached.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section [120.57](#)(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

Please contact Candy Cottle – Buyer II at 321-633-1000 ext.11635x or by email at [cottle.candy@brevardschools.org](mailto:cottle.candy@brevardschools.org) if you should have any questions. Thank you for your continued interest in The School Board of Brevard County, Florida.

Sincerely,

Kristine Rodriguez, MBA, CPPO, CPPB  
Director of Procurement and Distribution Services

TABSHEET ITS # 22-414-B-CC Print Shop Paper and Supplies 2.4.22 at 2:00 PM Opened By: Candy Cottle <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval 3.22.2022</b>			Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32207 Troy Youse Phone: 9043483300 troy.youse@macpapers.com			Office Depot 6600 N Military Trail Boca Raton, FL 33496 Kathleen Sinn Phone: 561 5774109 kathleen.sinn@officedepot.com			Sunshine Paper and Office Supplies 6278 N. Federal HWY 147 Ft Lauderdale, FL Pat Lynch Phone: 6316677904 utsamerica@yahoo.com			Agni Enterprises 2865 SW 69th Miami, FL 33155 Subbarayan Pochi Phone: 305 712 6653 cservice@headtoheels.net		
Lot Number	Description of Item	Unit	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
Completed Bidder's Acknowledgement														
FL Dept. of State Division of Corporations Number														
Litigations/Bankruptcy														
Addenda (if applicable)														
References Form														
Local Business Tax Receipts														
Current W-9														
Proof of Insurance														
Certified Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit (if applicable)														
Bidder's Statement of Principal Place of Business (if applicable)														
Lot 1 - Press Supplies II														
A)	Vanson Disposable Gloves (100 per box)	Per Box	\$ 15.98	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 8.31	OMAR MEDICAL SUPPLIES, INC.	5213/M	\$ 45.00	Vanson	Depends on size of gloves	\$ 37.80	Ammex	VSPF44100
B)	4" x 4" Cotton Pads (100 per package)	Per Case	\$ 225.44	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid		\$ 59.00	Webril	162792*	\$ 116.19	Dukal	DUK 1414-25
C)	Blanket Wash, Water Miscible 5 Gallon Container	Per 5 Gallon Can	\$ 170.80	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid		\$ 329.00	VARN	V-120	\$ 119.00	Graphic	WMS
D)	Padding Cement - 1 Gallon Container	Per Gallon	\$ 32.49	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid		\$ 120.00	HAR	20858	\$ 68.70	Uline	S-20858
Lot 2 - Large Format														
A)	Lamination Material - 30" x 250" - 3 Mil - Matte Finish, 2.25" core diameter	Per Roll	\$ 99.00	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 188.50	Transcendia	3M38500M		No Bid		\$ 71.60	Binding	19B382502PO
B)	Banner 13 oz. Matte - 39" x 164' - 14 Mil / 460gsm, 3" core diameter	Per Roll	\$ 119.63	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 227.50	ultraflex	JFM0965050-38		No Bid		\$ 155.40	HP	1A724A
C)	Banner 13 oz. Matte - 54" x 164' - 14 Mil / 460gsm, 3" core diameter	Per Roll	\$ 170.46	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 117.00	ultraflex	JFM137050-54		No Bid		\$ 218.40	HP	1A725A
D)	Adhesive Vinyl (Perminate) 54" x 150"	Per Roll	\$ 181.68	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 208.00	Arion Graphics	40515415202T		No Bid		\$ 222.60	Signworld	BGV54MAR
E)	Gloss Poster Paper 42" x 165"	Per Roll	\$ 200.75	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 169.00	Sihl	3686-54165		No Bid		\$ 202.78	Oce	604042200
F)	Mesh Banner - with PVC Iner 54" x 115"	Per Roll	\$ 335.50	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 305.50	DAF Products	SM-50/50PERF		No Bid		\$ 441.00	Coastal	XPESHAN54164
Lot 3 - Index - 110lb														
23" x 35"														
A)	White	Per Case 500 sheets	\$ 243.00	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 115.70	Springhill	015345	\$ 290.00	IP	0-15345	\$ 271.52	Strathmore	3-23-3023-F
B)	Regular, all colors	Per Case 500 Sheets	\$ 270.00	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 118.30	Springhill	Misc	\$ 329.00	IP	depends on color chosen	\$ 414.40	Neenah Paper	3-49566-F
8.5" x 11"														
C)	White 60# & 20#	Per Case 900 Sheets	\$ 87.22/case, 2,000/case 110#	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 247.00	Springhill	015300	\$ 98.00	Sopores/ IP	SD600811F /0-15345	\$ 471.17	NEENAH PAPER	WAU40411
D)	Regular, all colors 60# & 20#	Per Case 900 Sheets	\$ 91.50/case, 2,000/case 110#	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 256.75	Springhill	Misc	\$ 105.00	IP, Astrobright, Colorsprint	depends on color chosen	\$ 419.04	NEENAH PAPER	WAU49181
Lot 4 - Coated Stock														
23" x 35"														
A)	Cast Coated, 10pt., CCIS Cover	Per Case 500 sheets	\$ 320.63	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 364.00	Kromekote	K11035-F	\$ 515.00	Kromekote	k11035-f	\$ 551.60	CTI Paper USA	3-K11035-F
B)	Cast Coated, 14 pt., CCIS Cover	Per Case 500 Sheets	\$ 296.63	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 382.91	Kromekote	K11435-F	\$ 890.00	Kromekote	k11435-f	\$ 492.80	CTI Paper USA	3-K11435-F
11" x 17"														
C)	Cast Coated, 10 pt., CCSI Cover	Per Case 1000 sheets	\$ 241.39	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 208.00	Kromekote	K101711-F	\$ 350.00	Kromekote	k101711-f	\$ 145.52	CTI Paper USA	3-K101711-F-P
D)	Cast Coated, 12 pt., CCIS Cover	Per Case 500 Sheets	\$ 204.98	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 182.81	Kromekote	K121711-F	\$ 360.00	Kromekote	k12811-f	\$ 312.22	CTI Paper USA	3-K121711-F-P
E)	Dull Coated, 80 lb., Text	Per Case 1000 Sheets	\$ 47.44	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 73.67	condat	166301	\$ 150.00	Endurance	Digital Silk	\$ 69.86	Moorim Pape	
F)	Dull Coated, 70lb., Text	Per Case 2,000 sheets	N/A	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 130.00	condat	166298	Not Available	Not Available	Not Available	\$ 113.32	Opus	K12088
12" x 18"														
G)	Cast Coated, 10 pt., CCIS Cover	Per Case 500 Sheets	\$ 139.77	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 338.00	Kromekote	K11012-F	\$ 350.00	Kromekote	k101711-f	\$ 269.92	CTI Paper	K11012-F
Lot 5 - Carbonless Paper - Pre Collated Only - All Sheets 20 lbs.														
8.5" x 11"														
A)	2 part - White, Yellow - Reverse	Per Case 5000 sheets	\$ 159.16	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 277.96	Xerox	3R12420	\$ 120.00	Superior	5887	\$ 349.93	NCR Forms	SKU104
B)	3 part - White, Yellow, Pink - Reverse and/or straight	Per Case 5000 sheets	\$ 179.69	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 487.72	Xerox	3R12427	\$ 130.00	Superior	5900/5909	\$ 419.93	NCR Forms	SKU127
C)	4 part - White, Yellow, Pink, Gold - Reverse and/or Straight	Per Case 5000 sheets	\$ 192.04	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 687.92	Xerox	3R12430	\$ 160.00	Superior	5915/5925	\$ 398.93	NCR Forms	SKU110
D)	5 part - White, Green, Yellow, Pink, Gold - Reverse and/or Straight	Per Case 5000 sheets	\$ 197.17	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid		\$ 189.00	Superior	5930	\$ 426.93	NCR Forms	SKU5000
8.5" x 14" Short Grain														
E)	2 part - White, Yellow - Reverse	Per Case 5000 sheets	\$ 203.72	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid		\$ 150.00	Superior	5919	\$ 391.93	NCR Forms	SKU114
F)	3 part - White, Yellow, Pink - Reverse and/or Straight	Per Case 5000 sheets	\$ 230.00	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid		\$ 160.00	Superior	5902/5910	\$ 426.93	NCR Forms	SKU117
G)	4 part - White, Yellow, Pink, Gold - Reverse and/or Straight	Per Case 5000 sheets	\$ 245.81	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid		\$ 190.00	Superior	5917/5926	\$ 454.93	NCR Forms	SKU121
H)	5 part - White, Green, Yellow, Pink, Gold - Reverse and/or Straight	Per Case 5000 sheets	\$ 252.38	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid		\$ 219.00	Superior	5931	\$ 426.93	NCR Forms	SKU5000
NCR Fan Apart Padding Compound, 1 Gallon Container														
Lot 6 - Offset, Recycled														

Recommended Award Key: Columns highlighted in yellow identify the recommended award.  
 All other bidders did not meet the definition of responsive and responsible for this bid as outlined in Section 2.10

TABSHEET ITB # 22-414-B-CC Print Shop Paper and Supplies 2.4.22 at 2:00 PM Opened By: Candy Cottle This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval Date 3.22.2022			Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32207 Troy Youse Phone: 9043483300 troy.youse@macpapers.com			Office Depot 6600 N Military Trail Boca Raton, FL 33496 Kathleen Sinn Phone: 561 5774109 kathleen.sinn@officedepot.com			Sunshine Paper and Office Supplies 6278 N. Federal HWY 147 Ft Lauderdale, FL Pat Lynch Phone: 6316677904 utsamerica@yahoo.com			Agri Enterprises 2865 SW 63rd Miami, FL 33155 Subbarayan Pochi Phone: 305 712 6653 cservice@headtoheels.net																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																													
Lot Number	Description of Item	Unit	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
Completed Bidder's Acknowledgement																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
FL Dept. of State Division of Corporations Number																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
Litigations/Bankruptcy																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
Addenda (if applicable)																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
References Form																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
Local Business Tax Receipts																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
Current W-9																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
Proof of Insurance																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
Certified Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit (if applicable)																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
Bidder's Statement of Principal Place of Business (if applicable)																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Lot Number</th> <th>Description of Item</th> <th>Unit</th> <th>Unit Pricing</th> <th>Manufacturer</th> <th>Manufacturer #</th> <th>Unit Pricing</th> <th>Manufacturer</th> <th>Manufacturer #</th> <th>Unit Pricing</th> <th>Manufacturer</th> <th>Manufacturer #</th> <th>Unit Pricing</th> <th>Manufacturer</th> <th>Manufacturer #</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td colspan="15"><b>Opaque Color, 60lb</b></td> </tr> <tr> <td>A)</td> <td>8.5" x 11" White</td> <td>Per Case/ 5000 sheets</td> <td>\$ 81.75</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 110.50</td> <td>Husky</td> <td>5462</td> <td>\$ 175.00</td> <td>IP, Cougar or Lynx</td> <td>10935-5,2834,630400</td> <td>\$ 213.78</td> <td>Accent Opaque</td> <td>10935-5</td> </tr> <tr> <td>B)</td> <td>8.5" x 11" Brights, all colors</td> <td>Per Case/ 5000 sheets</td> <td>\$ 157.50</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 182.00</td> <td>Astrobrights</td> <td>Misc</td> <td>\$ 225.00</td> <td>Astrobright</td> <td>depends on color chosen</td> <td>\$ 335.58</td> <td>Neenah Paper</td> <td>3-22671-F-P</td> </tr> <tr> <td>C)</td> <td>8.5" x 11" Regular, all colors</td> <td>Per Case/ 5000 sheets</td> <td>\$ 95.50</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 123.50</td> <td>Springhill</td> <td>Misc</td> <td>\$ 190.00</td> <td>Springhill</td> <td>depends on color chosen</td> <td>\$ 419.58</td> <td>Neenah Paper</td> <td>3-27151-F-P</td> </tr> <tr> <td>D)</td> <td>8.5" X 14" White</td> <td>Per Case/ 4000 sheets</td> <td>\$ 86.80</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 146.25</td> <td>Husky</td> <td>5464</td> <td>\$ 290.00</td> <td>IP</td> <td>18803-3</td> <td>\$ 237.86</td> <td>Accent</td> <td>188033R</td> </tr> <tr> <td colspan="15"><b>Opaque Color, Cover</b></td> </tr> <tr> <td>E)</td> <td>8.5" x 11" White, 80lb Lynx</td> <td>Per Case/ 2000 sheets</td> <td>\$ 86.80</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 117.00</td> <td>Lynx</td> <td>638800</td> <td>\$ 159.00</td> <td>Lynx</td> <td>638800</td> <td>\$ 169.46</td> <td>MOHAWK FINE</td> <td>MOW12214</td> </tr> <tr> <td>F)</td> <td>8.5" x 11" Brights, all colors 65lb.</td> <td>Per Case/ 2000 sheets</td> <td>\$ 106.40</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 182.00</td> <td>Astrobrights</td> <td>Misc</td> <td>\$ 269.00</td> <td>Astrobright</td> <td>depends on color chosen</td> <td>\$ 404.06</td> <td>PACON</td> <td>PAC101169</td> </tr> <tr> <td>G)</td> <td>8.5" x 11" Regular, all colors 65lb.</td> <td>Per Case/ 2000 sheets</td> <td>\$ 79.96</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 104.00</td> <td>Springhill</td> <td>Misc</td> <td>\$ 249.00</td> <td>Springhill</td> <td>depends on color chosen</td> <td>\$ 156.67</td> <td>NEENAH PAPER</td> <td>WAU22731</td> </tr> <tr> <td colspan="15"><b>Smooth, 60lb</b></td> </tr> <tr> <td>H)</td> <td>11" x 17" White</td> <td>Per Case/2000 sheets</td> <td>\$ 81.75</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 123.50</td> <td>Husky</td> <td>8947</td> <td>\$ 198.00</td> <td>Soporsat</td> <td>SD601117F</td> <td>\$ 456.34</td> <td>HAMMERMILL/HP</td> <td>HAM122556</td> </tr> <tr> <td>I)</td> <td>11" x 17" Brights, all colors</td> <td>Per Case/2000 sheets</td> <td>\$ 139.13</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 191.10</td> <td>Astrobrights</td> <td>Misc</td> <td>\$ 325.00</td> <td>Astrobright</td> <td>depends on color chosen</td> <td>\$ 300.79</td> <td>Neenah Paper</td> <td>3-22533-F-P</td> </tr> <tr> <td>J)</td> <td>11" x 17" Regular, all colors</td> <td>Per Case/2000 sheets</td> <td>\$ 99.95</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 128.70</td> <td>Springhill</td> <td>Misc</td> <td>\$ 250.00</td> <td>Astrobright</td> <td>depends on color chosen</td> <td>\$ 307.23</td> <td>Springhill</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td colspan="15"><b>Smooth, 20lb</b></td> </tr> <tr> <td>K)</td> <td>8.5" x 11" White</td> <td>Per Case/ 5000 sheets</td> <td>\$ 42.80</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 40.95</td> <td>Xerox</td> <td>3R02047</td> <td>\$ 139.00</td> <td>Lynx</td> <td>630000</td> <td>\$ 78.78</td> <td>UNIVERSAL OFFICE</td> <td>UNV21200</td> </tr> <tr> <td>L)</td> <td>11" x 17" White</td> <td>Per Case/ 2000 sheets</td> <td>\$ 59.50</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 100.24</td> <td>Xerox</td> <td>3R03871</td> <td>\$ 189.00</td> <td>Lynx</td> <td>630300</td> <td>\$ 94.22</td> <td>UNIVERSAL OFFICE</td> <td>UNV28110</td> </tr> <tr> <td colspan="15"><b>Lot 7 - Offset</b></td> </tr> <tr> <td>A)</td> <td>60 lb. Offset, Smooth Finish, White, 17.5" x 22.5"</td> <td>Per Stack/ 17,000 sheets</td> <td>\$ 867.51</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 1,174.00</td> <td>Williamsburg</td> <td>05328</td> <td>\$ 2,190.00</td> <td>Lynx</td> <td>231100</td> <td>\$ 2,403.80</td> <td>Domtar</td> <td>2495</td> </tr> <tr> <td colspan="15"><b>Lot 8 - Stationary Papers, Recycled</b></td> </tr> <tr> <td>A)</td> <td>25% Royal Cotton Writing, Light Cockle, Bright White, 8.5" x 11"</td> <td>Per Case/ 4000 sheets</td> <td>\$ 221.84</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>\$ 195.79</td> <td>Neenah Paper</td> <td>3-29496-F-P</td> </tr> <tr> <td colspan="15"><b>Lot 9 - Envelopes</b></td> </tr> <tr> <td>A)</td> <td>#10 Window Envelopes</td> <td>Per Case/ 2500</td> <td>\$ 71.25</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 56.35</td> <td>Office Depot</td> <td>MPA/OD/150</td> <td>\$ 180.00</td> <td>U-Line</td> <td>S-14622</td> <td>\$ 221.47</td> <td>UNIVERSAL OFFICE</td> <td>UNV35211</td> </tr> <tr> <td>B)</td> <td>#10 Plain Envelopes, White, 24lb</td> <td>Per Case/ 2500</td> <td>\$ 63.15</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 53.25</td> <td>Office Depot</td> <td>ODP78170</td> <td>\$ 100.00</td> <td>U-Line</td> <td>S-7801</td> <td>\$ 105.96</td> <td>UNIVERSAL OFFICE</td> <td>UNV35210</td> </tr> <tr> <td>C)</td> <td>7" x 10" Plain Clasp Envelopes, Brown</td> <td>Per Case/1 000</td> <td>\$ 240.80</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 190.00</td> <td>Quality Park</td> <td>QUA37868</td> <td>\$ 900.00</td> <td>U-Line</td> <td>S-6282 (7 1/2 x 10 1/2)</td> <td>\$ 452.02</td> <td>QUALITY PARK</td> <td>QUA37868</td> </tr> <tr> <td colspan="15"><b>Lot 10 - Index Tabs</b></td> </tr> <tr> <td>A)</td> <td>Single Reverse, 5 Bank, #90, White Index</td> <td>1200 sheets per case</td> <td>\$ 108.93</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>\$ 329.00</td> <td>Xerox</td> <td>LM7103</td> <td>\$ 1,019.69</td> <td>UNIVERSAL OFFICE</td> <td>UNV20835</td> </tr> <tr> <td colspan="15"><b>Lot 11 - Bindry Supply, Recycled</b></td> </tr> <tr> <td>A)</td> <td>Shipping Cartons - 17.5" x 11.5" x 11.5", 25/Bundle</td> <td>Per Bundle of 25</td> <td>\$ 28.75</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 43.68</td> <td>Office Depot</td> <td>171111</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>\$ 95.82</td> <td>GEN</td> <td>UFS161212</td> </tr> <tr> <td>B)</td> <td>Shipping Cartons Jr. - 11.25" x 8.75" x 11.5", 25/Bundle</td> <td>Per Bundle of 25</td> <td>\$ 19.41</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>\$ 28.80</td> <td>Office Depot</td> <td>11812</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>\$ 78.52</td> <td>GEN</td> <td>UFS11812</td> </tr> <tr> <td>C)</td> <td>Stationery Boxes - 11 1/8" x 8 5/8" x 2", 100/Box</td> <td>Per Case of 100 boxes</td> <td>\$ 80.51</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td>\$ 432.24</td> <td>Partners Brand</td> <td>G6595900</td> </tr> <tr> <td>D)</td> <td>Stationery Boxes - 11 3/8" x 8 7/8" x 4", 100/Box</td> <td>Per Case of 100 boxes</td> <td>\$ 124.30</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>E)</td> <td>Stationery Boxes - 14 3/8" x 8 7/8" x 2", 100/Box</td> <td>Per Case of 100 boxes</td> <td>\$ 148.87</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td>Not Specified</td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td>No Bid</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td colspan="15"><b>Lot 12 - Balance of Product Line</b></td> </tr> <tr> <td colspan="2">A) Balance of Product Line on Color/Black Coils: Size 8mm - 25mm</td> <td>List Minus</td> <td colspan="3">40% - Cost Plus</td> <td colspan="3">No Bid</td> <td colspan="3">No Bid</td> <td colspan="3">No Bid</td> </tr> <tr> <td colspan="2">B) Balance of Product Line on Paper Stock not itemized above</td> <td>List Minus</td> <td colspan="3">40% - Cost Plus</td> <td colspan="3">60%</td> <td colspan="3">No Bid</td> <td colspan="3">No Bid</td> </tr> <tr> <td colspan="2">Percentage of rate designated for fuel costs</td> <td>This will be used to redetermine fuel costs if necessary.</td> <td colspan="3"></td> <td colspan="3"></td> <td colspan="3"></td> <td colspan="3"></td> </tr> </tbody> </table>															Lot Number	Description of Item	Unit	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #	<b>Opaque Color, 60lb</b>															A)	8.5" x 11" White	Per Case/ 5000 sheets	\$ 81.75	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 110.50	Husky	5462	\$ 175.00	IP, Cougar or Lynx	10935-5,2834,630400	\$ 213.78	Accent Opaque	10935-5	B)	8.5" x 11" Brights, all colors	Per Case/ 5000 sheets	\$ 157.50	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 182.00	Astrobrights	Misc	\$ 225.00	Astrobright	depends on color chosen	\$ 335.58	Neenah Paper	3-22671-F-P	C)	8.5" x 11" Regular, all colors	Per Case/ 5000 sheets	\$ 95.50	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 123.50	Springhill	Misc	\$ 190.00	Springhill	depends on color chosen	\$ 419.58	Neenah Paper	3-27151-F-P	D)	8.5" X 14" White	Per Case/ 4000 sheets	\$ 86.80	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 146.25	Husky	5464	\$ 290.00	IP	18803-3	\$ 237.86	Accent	188033R	<b>Opaque Color, Cover</b>															E)	8.5" x 11" White, 80lb Lynx	Per Case/ 2000 sheets	\$ 86.80	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 117.00	Lynx	638800	\$ 159.00	Lynx	638800	\$ 169.46	MOHAWK FINE	MOW12214	F)	8.5" x 11" Brights, all colors 65lb.	Per Case/ 2000 sheets	\$ 106.40	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 182.00	Astrobrights	Misc	\$ 269.00	Astrobright	depends on color chosen	\$ 404.06	PACON	PAC101169	G)	8.5" x 11" Regular, all colors 65lb.	Per Case/ 2000 sheets	\$ 79.96	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 104.00	Springhill	Misc	\$ 249.00	Springhill	depends on color chosen	\$ 156.67	NEENAH PAPER	WAU22731	<b>Smooth, 60lb</b>															H)	11" x 17" White	Per Case/2000 sheets	\$ 81.75	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 123.50	Husky	8947	\$ 198.00	Soporsat	SD601117F	\$ 456.34	HAMMERMILL/HP	HAM122556	I)	11" x 17" Brights, all colors	Per Case/2000 sheets	\$ 139.13	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 191.10	Astrobrights	Misc	\$ 325.00	Astrobright	depends on color chosen	\$ 300.79	Neenah Paper	3-22533-F-P	J)	11" x 17" Regular, all colors	Per Case/2000 sheets	\$ 99.95	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 128.70	Springhill	Misc	\$ 250.00	Astrobright	depends on color chosen	\$ 307.23	Springhill		<b>Smooth, 20lb</b>															K)	8.5" x 11" White	Per Case/ 5000 sheets	\$ 42.80	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 40.95	Xerox	3R02047	\$ 139.00	Lynx	630000	\$ 78.78	UNIVERSAL OFFICE	UNV21200	L)	11" x 17" White	Per Case/ 2000 sheets	\$ 59.50	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 100.24	Xerox	3R03871	\$ 189.00	Lynx	630300	\$ 94.22	UNIVERSAL OFFICE	UNV28110	<b>Lot 7 - Offset</b>															A)	60 lb. Offset, Smooth Finish, White, 17.5" x 22.5"	Per Stack/ 17,000 sheets	\$ 867.51	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 1,174.00	Williamsburg	05328	\$ 2,190.00	Lynx	231100	\$ 2,403.80	Domtar	2495	<b>Lot 8 - Stationary Papers, Recycled</b>															A)	25% Royal Cotton Writing, Light Cockle, Bright White, 8.5" x 11"	Per Case/ 4000 sheets	\$ 221.84	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid			No Bid		\$ 195.79	Neenah Paper	3-29496-F-P	<b>Lot 9 - Envelopes</b>															A)	#10 Window Envelopes	Per Case/ 2500	\$ 71.25	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 56.35	Office Depot	MPA/OD/150	\$ 180.00	U-Line	S-14622	\$ 221.47	UNIVERSAL OFFICE	UNV35211	B)	#10 Plain Envelopes, White, 24lb	Per Case/ 2500	\$ 63.15	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 53.25	Office Depot	ODP78170	\$ 100.00	U-Line	S-7801	\$ 105.96	UNIVERSAL OFFICE	UNV35210	C)	7" x 10" Plain Clasp Envelopes, Brown	Per Case/1 000	\$ 240.80	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 190.00	Quality Park	QUA37868	\$ 900.00	U-Line	S-6282 (7 1/2 x 10 1/2)	\$ 452.02	QUALITY PARK	QUA37868	<b>Lot 10 - Index Tabs</b>															A)	Single Reverse, 5 Bank, #90, White Index	1200 sheets per case	\$ 108.93	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid		\$ 329.00	Xerox	LM7103	\$ 1,019.69	UNIVERSAL OFFICE	UNV20835	<b>Lot 11 - Bindry Supply, Recycled</b>															A)	Shipping Cartons - 17.5" x 11.5" x 11.5", 25/Bundle	Per Bundle of 25	\$ 28.75	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 43.68	Office Depot	171111		No Bid		\$ 95.82	GEN	UFS161212	B)	Shipping Cartons Jr. - 11.25" x 8.75" x 11.5", 25/Bundle	Per Bundle of 25	\$ 19.41	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 28.80	Office Depot	11812		No Bid		\$ 78.52	GEN	UFS11812	C)	Stationery Boxes - 11 1/8" x 8 5/8" x 2", 100/Box	Per Case of 100 boxes	\$ 80.51	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid			No Bid		\$ 432.24	Partners Brand	G6595900	D)	Stationery Boxes - 11 3/8" x 8 7/8" x 4", 100/Box	Per Case of 100 boxes	\$ 124.30	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		E)	Stationery Boxes - 14 3/8" x 8 7/8" x 2", 100/Box	Per Case of 100 boxes	\$ 148.87	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		<b>Lot 12 - Balance of Product Line</b>															A) Balance of Product Line on Color/Black Coils: Size 8mm - 25mm		List Minus	40% - Cost Plus			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			B) Balance of Product Line on Paper Stock not itemized above		List Minus	40% - Cost Plus			60%			No Bid			No Bid			Percentage of rate designated for fuel costs		This will be used to redetermine fuel costs if necessary.												
Lot Number	Description of Item	Unit	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #	Unit Pricing	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
<b>Opaque Color, 60lb</b>																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
A)	8.5" x 11" White	Per Case/ 5000 sheets	\$ 81.75	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 110.50	Husky	5462	\$ 175.00	IP, Cougar or Lynx	10935-5,2834,630400	\$ 213.78	Accent Opaque	10935-5																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
B)	8.5" x 11" Brights, all colors	Per Case/ 5000 sheets	\$ 157.50	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 182.00	Astrobrights	Misc	\$ 225.00	Astrobright	depends on color chosen	\$ 335.58	Neenah Paper	3-22671-F-P																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
C)	8.5" x 11" Regular, all colors	Per Case/ 5000 sheets	\$ 95.50	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 123.50	Springhill	Misc	\$ 190.00	Springhill	depends on color chosen	\$ 419.58	Neenah Paper	3-27151-F-P																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
D)	8.5" X 14" White	Per Case/ 4000 sheets	\$ 86.80	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 146.25	Husky	5464	\$ 290.00	IP	18803-3	\$ 237.86	Accent	188033R																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
<b>Opaque Color, Cover</b>																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
E)	8.5" x 11" White, 80lb Lynx	Per Case/ 2000 sheets	\$ 86.80	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 117.00	Lynx	638800	\$ 159.00	Lynx	638800	\$ 169.46	MOHAWK FINE	MOW12214																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
F)	8.5" x 11" Brights, all colors 65lb.	Per Case/ 2000 sheets	\$ 106.40	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 182.00	Astrobrights	Misc	\$ 269.00	Astrobright	depends on color chosen	\$ 404.06	PACON	PAC101169																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
G)	8.5" x 11" Regular, all colors 65lb.	Per Case/ 2000 sheets	\$ 79.96	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 104.00	Springhill	Misc	\$ 249.00	Springhill	depends on color chosen	\$ 156.67	NEENAH PAPER	WAU22731																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
<b>Smooth, 60lb</b>																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
H)	11" x 17" White	Per Case/2000 sheets	\$ 81.75	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 123.50	Husky	8947	\$ 198.00	Soporsat	SD601117F	\$ 456.34	HAMMERMILL/HP	HAM122556																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
I)	11" x 17" Brights, all colors	Per Case/2000 sheets	\$ 139.13	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 191.10	Astrobrights	Misc	\$ 325.00	Astrobright	depends on color chosen	\$ 300.79	Neenah Paper	3-22533-F-P																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
J)	11" x 17" Regular, all colors	Per Case/2000 sheets	\$ 99.95	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 128.70	Springhill	Misc	\$ 250.00	Astrobright	depends on color chosen	\$ 307.23	Springhill																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																												
<b>Smooth, 20lb</b>																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
K)	8.5" x 11" White	Per Case/ 5000 sheets	\$ 42.80	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 40.95	Xerox	3R02047	\$ 139.00	Lynx	630000	\$ 78.78	UNIVERSAL OFFICE	UNV21200																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
L)	11" x 17" White	Per Case/ 2000 sheets	\$ 59.50	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 100.24	Xerox	3R03871	\$ 189.00	Lynx	630300	\$ 94.22	UNIVERSAL OFFICE	UNV28110																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
<b>Lot 7 - Offset</b>																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
A)	60 lb. Offset, Smooth Finish, White, 17.5" x 22.5"	Per Stack/ 17,000 sheets	\$ 867.51	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 1,174.00	Williamsburg	05328	\$ 2,190.00	Lynx	231100	\$ 2,403.80	Domtar	2495																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
<b>Lot 8 - Stationary Papers, Recycled</b>																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
A)	25% Royal Cotton Writing, Light Cockle, Bright White, 8.5" x 11"	Per Case/ 4000 sheets	\$ 221.84	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid			No Bid		\$ 195.79	Neenah Paper	3-29496-F-P																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
<b>Lot 9 - Envelopes</b>																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
A)	#10 Window Envelopes	Per Case/ 2500	\$ 71.25	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 56.35	Office Depot	MPA/OD/150	\$ 180.00	U-Line	S-14622	\$ 221.47	UNIVERSAL OFFICE	UNV35211																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
B)	#10 Plain Envelopes, White, 24lb	Per Case/ 2500	\$ 63.15	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 53.25	Office Depot	ODP78170	\$ 100.00	U-Line	S-7801	\$ 105.96	UNIVERSAL OFFICE	UNV35210																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
C)	7" x 10" Plain Clasp Envelopes, Brown	Per Case/1 000	\$ 240.80	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 190.00	Quality Park	QUA37868	\$ 900.00	U-Line	S-6282 (7 1/2 x 10 1/2)	\$ 452.02	QUALITY PARK	QUA37868																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
<b>Lot 10 - Index Tabs</b>																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
A)	Single Reverse, 5 Bank, #90, White Index	1200 sheets per case	\$ 108.93	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid		\$ 329.00	Xerox	LM7103	\$ 1,019.69	UNIVERSAL OFFICE	UNV20835																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
<b>Lot 11 - Bindry Supply, Recycled</b>																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
A)	Shipping Cartons - 17.5" x 11.5" x 11.5", 25/Bundle	Per Bundle of 25	\$ 28.75	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 43.68	Office Depot	171111		No Bid		\$ 95.82	GEN	UFS161212																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
B)	Shipping Cartons Jr. - 11.25" x 8.75" x 11.5", 25/Bundle	Per Bundle of 25	\$ 19.41	Not Specified	Not Specified	\$ 28.80	Office Depot	11812		No Bid		\$ 78.52	GEN	UFS11812																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
C)	Stationery Boxes - 11 1/8" x 8 5/8" x 2", 100/Box	Per Case of 100 boxes	\$ 80.51	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid			No Bid		\$ 432.24	Partners Brand	G6595900																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																											
D)	Stationery Boxes - 11 3/8" x 8 7/8" x 4", 100/Box	Per Case of 100 boxes	\$ 124.30	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																												
E)	Stationery Boxes - 14 3/8" x 8 7/8" x 2", 100/Box	Per Case of 100 boxes	\$ 148.87	Not Specified	Not Specified		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																												
<b>Lot 12 - Balance of Product Line</b>																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																									
A) Balance of Product Line on Color/Black Coils: Size 8mm - 25mm		List Minus	40% - Cost Plus			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																													
B) Balance of Product Line on Paper Stock not itemized above		List Minus	40% - Cost Plus			60%			No Bid			No Bid																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																													
Percentage of rate designated for fuel costs		This will be used to redetermine fuel costs if necessary.																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																																							