

**SCHOOL BOARD OF BREVARD COUNTY, FLORIDA**

**BOARD AGENDA ITEM – November 17, 2020**

**PROCUREMENT SOLICITATION**

**ITB #21-064-B-JE Herbicides, Pesticides, and Fertilizers**

<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <b>(ITB)</b> Invitation To Bid	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(ITN)</b> Invitation To Negotiate	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(PB)</b> Piggyback
<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(RFP)</b> Request For Proposal	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(RFQ)</b> Request For Qualifications	<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(SC)</b> State Contract
<input type="checkbox"/> <b>(SS)</b> Sole Source		

**REQUESTOR:** Plant Operations & Maintenance

**Legal Review Required:**  Yes  No

**Standard Template Used with No Changes:**  Yes  No

**Standard Template Type:** ITB

VENDOR NAME	AMOUNT AWARDED	AWARD
Alligare, LLC Target Specialty Products Diamond R. Fertilizer Co., Inc. ES OPCO USA, LLC Harrell's, LLC Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Howard Fertilizer and Chemical Co., Inc. MAR Green Resources, LLC SiteOne Landscape Supply Winfield Solutions	Variable	As outlined on the attached tabulation.
<b>Total</b>	Variable	

<input type="checkbox"/> <b>Contract Renewal</b>	<b>New Contract Amount</b>	Variable
<input type="checkbox"/> <b>Recurring Contract</b>	<b>Previous Contract Amount</b>	Variable
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <b>New Contract</b>	<b>Variance</b>	N/A

**PRICE INCREASE / DECREASE EXPLANATION:** N/A

**DISCUSSION:**

Herbicides, Pesticides, and Fertilizers will be purchased from awarded vendors on an as needed basis by the Plant Operations & Maintenance and Environmental Health & Safety departments.

The standard Invitation to Bid template has been used, which does not require legal review.

**CONTRACT TERM:**

The initial contract term shall commence November 18, 2020 and continue until November 17, 2023 with one (1) optional two (2) year renewal period.

**RECOMMENDATION:**

It is the recommendation of Susan Hann, Assistant Superintendent of Facilities Services and Jim Powers, Manager of Environmental Health & Safety to approve the attached award tabulation with the above listed vendors based upon a variable award amount.

**AUTHORITY FOR ACTION:**

Florida Administrative Code 6A-1.012

<p><b>TABSHEET</b>  <b>ITB # 21-064-B-JE</b>  Herbicides, Pesticides, and Fertilizers  <b>August 25, 2020 at 2:00 PM</b>  Opened By: Janice Ellis  Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells  <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval October 6, 2020</b></p> <p><b>Date Solicited: July 30, 2020</b>  <b>Date Opened: August 25, 2020</b></p> <p><b># Solicited 424 # MWBE 56</b>  <b># Planholders 25 # Submittals 11</b></p>																							
<p>Alligare, LLC  1565 5th Avenue, Opelika, AL 36801  Norma Cassinari  772-473-7333  ngcassinari@alligare.com</p>																							
<p>Target Specialty Products  7380 Phillips Hwy Suite 303, Jax., FL 32256  Chad Martin, Territory Manager  904-728-8736  chad.martin@target-specialty.com</p>																							
<p>Diamond R. Fertilizer Co., Inc.  4100 Glades Cutoff Road, Fort Pierce, FL 34981  Thom Chester  772-201-0099  thomchester@comcast.net</p>																							
<p>ES OPCO USA LLC  7501 Municipal Drive  Orlando, FL 328196  Mark Schneiderwind, Customer Service Manager  407-843-2611  mark.schneiderwind@veseris.com</p>																							
<p>Harrell's, LLC  P.O. Box 807, Lakeland, FL 33802  Dave Nowakowski  786-390-9154  dnowakowski@Harrells.com</p>																							
<p>Helena Chemical Company  P.O. Box 1758, Dade City, FL 33526  Mike Giddens, Sales Representative  352-567-5622  giddensc@helenaagri.com</p>																							
<p>Howard Fertilizer &amp; Chemical Co., Inc  8306 South Orange Ave., Orlando, FL 32809  Todd Ronske  352-427-5596  Tronske@Howardfert.com</p>																							
<p>MAR Green Resources LLC  P.O. Box 563, Loxahatchee, FL 33470  Kriss Ramroop  561-791-6298  sales@margreenresources.com</p>																							
<p>SiteOne Landscape Supply  1385 East 36th Street, Cleveland, Ohio 44114  Keith McGinty, Director  216-706-9250 ext. 2  bids@siteone.com</p>																							
<p>Winfield Solutions, LLC  2601 W. Orange Blossom Trail, Apopka, FL 32712  Ken Gagne, Territory Manager-Central Florida  407-256-6710  kwgagne@landlakes.com</p>																							
<p>PowerX</p>																							
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	Estimated Quantity & Unit	Mfg.	Unit Cost	Mfg.	Unit Cost	Mfg.	Unit Cost	Mfg.	Unit Cost	Mfg.	Unit Cost	Mfg.	Unit Cost	Mfg.	Unit Cost	Mfg.	Unit Cost	Mfg.	Unit Cost	Mfg.	Unit Cost	
1	TCS Grow Star - Oxadiazon 1.0 Plus Turf Fertilizer (15-1-15) or equal: Total Nitrogen (N) 15% 0.4% Ammoniacal Nitrogen 14.6% Urea Nitrogen Available Phosphate 1.0% Soluble Potash 15.0% Total Sulfur 2.3% Chlorine Max. 11.3% Granular Grade 22-250-SGN and the statement of no ag blends	3000 or More 50 lb. Bags	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer HOWARDS FERT Part # I505523	\$31.80	<R> 15-1-15 w/ 1% Oxadiazon #CB15115 Ox	\$ 33.74	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Harrell's Part # 2008-5037	\$ 32.89	Blend 19550-B	\$ 36.25	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Sunniland Part # 02020742	\$ 32.00	Lesco, #702495, Lesco Ronstar 0.95 15-0-15 50lb.	\$ 37.50	No Bid	No Bid	
2	Prosource One Fertilizer (16-2-16) or equal: Total Nitrogen (N) 16% 0.4% Ammoniacal Nitrogen 12.0% Urea Nitrogen Available Phosphate 2.0% Soluble Potash 16.0% Chlorine, not more than 7.5% Soluble Magnesium and Mg 2.0% Total Manganese and Mn 1.8% Water Sol Manganese as Mn 0.18% Total Iron as Fe 2.0% Soluble Iron as Fe 0.10% Granular Grade 22-250-SGN and the statement of no ag blends	4000 - 50 lb.Bags	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BEATY FERT Part # I501699	\$13.50	<R> 16-2-16 #CB16216	\$ 17.89	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Harrell's Part # 2008-5038	\$ 16.42	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Wedgworth Part # 66690	\$ 17.40	Custom blend, #16-2-16	\$ 18.48	No Bid	No Bid	
3	Prosource One Fertilizer (8-10-10) Acid Palm and Shrub or equal: Total Nitrogen (N) 8.0% 4.0% Ammoniacal Nitrogen Other water soluble Nitrogen 4.0% 12.0% Urea Nitrogen Available Phosphorous 10.0% Soluble Potash 10.0% Chlorine, not more than 2.0% Soluble Magnesium and Mg 2.0% Total Manganese and Mn 2.0% Water Sol Manganese as Mn 0.04% Total Copper 0.06% Total Iron as Fe 3.0% Total Zinc 0.14% Boron 0.06% Granular Grade 22-250-SGN and the statement of no ag blends	900 or More 50 lb. Bags	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BEATYS FERT Part # I501702	\$12.75	<R> 8-10-10 #YF2004	\$ 17.13	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Harrell's Part # 2008-5039	\$ 15.56	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Wedgworth Part # 66691	\$ 15.40	Lesco #098600, Lesco Palm & Tropical 8-10-10, 50-lb	\$ 17.75	No Bid	No Bid	

Recommended Award Key: Columns highlighted in yellow identify the recommended award.  
All other bidders did not meet the definition of responsive and responsible for this bid as outlined in Section 2.10

<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB # 21-064-B-JE</b> Herbicides, Pesticides, and Fertilizers <b>August 25, 2020 at 2:00 PM</b> Opened By: Janice Ellis Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval October 6, 2020</b>  <b>Date Solicited: July 30, 2020</b> <b>Date Opened: August 25, 2020</b> <b># Solicited 424 # MWBE 56</b> <b># Planholders 25 # Submittals 11</b>		Alligare, LLC 1565 5th Avenue, Opelika, AL 36801 Norma Cassinari 772-473-7333 ngcassinari@alligare.com		Target Specialty Products 7380 Phillips Hwy Suite 303, Jax., FL 32256 Chad Martin, Territory Manager 904-728-8736 chad.martin@target-specialty.com		Diamond R. Fertilizer Co., Inc. 4100 Glades Cutoff Road, Fort Pierce, FL 34981 Thom Chester 772-201-0099 thomchester@comcast.net		ES OPCO USA LLC 7501 Municipal Drive Orlando, FL 328196 Mark Schneiderwind, Customer Service Manager 407-843-2611 mark.schneiderwind@veseris.com		Harrell's, LLC P.O. Box 807, Lakeland, FL 33802 Dave Nowakowski 786-390-9154 dnowakowski@Harrells.com		Helena Chemical Company P.O. Box 1758, Dade City, FL 33526 Mike Giddens, Sales Representative 352-567-5622 giddensc@helenaagri.com		Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Co., Inc 8306 South Orange Ave., Orlando, FL 32809 Todd Ronske 352-427-5596 Tronske@Howardfert.com		MAR Green Resources LLC P.O. Box 563, Loxahatchee, FL 33470 Kris Ramroop 561-791-6298 sales@magreenresources.com		SiteOne Landscape Supply 1385 East 36th Street, Cleveland, Ohio 44114 Keith McGinty, Director 216-706-9250 ext. 2 bids@siteone.com		Winfield Solutions, LLC 2601 W. Orange Blossom Trail, Apopka, FL 32712 Ken Gagne, Territory Manager-Central Florida 407-256-6710 kwgagne@landlakes.com		PowerX
4	Prosource One Fertilizer (21-0-0) Fairways or equal: Total Nitrogen (N) 21.0% 21.0% Ammoniacal Nitrogen Chlorine, not more than 2.0% Sulfer 24.0% Granular Grade 22-250-SGN and the statement of no ag blends	900 or More 50 lb. Bags	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer CIS Part # i508620	\$ 12.08	<R> 21-0-0 #F0321	\$ 14.40	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Harrell's Part # 200060	\$ 12.61	Fairway #21-0-0	\$ 11.00	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Wedgworth Part # 66692	\$ 12.50	Lesco, #098660, Lesco 21-0-0, 50-lb	\$ 12.50	No Bid	No Bid
5	Dylox 6.2 Granular Insecticide or equal: Active Ingredients: Trichlorfon, Dimethyl Phosphonate 6.2% Inert Ingredients: 93.8%	120 or More 30 lb. Bags	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BAYER Part # i50056	\$ 40.11	Dylox 6.2 G #Y2330	\$ 50.10	Manufacturer: Bayer Environmental Science Part # 647470	\$ 40.65	Manufacturer Bayer Part # Dylox	\$ 40.56		\$ 40.50	Manufacturer: Bayer Part # 1003693	\$ 39.09	Manufacturer Bayer Part # BYT909274	\$ 42.00	Bayer, #909274	\$ 41.00	Manufacturer BAYER Part # 10001008	\$ 39.90
6	Winfield Solutions Surf-King Plus or equal Principal Functioning Agents: Nonylphenol Polyethylene glycol ether fatty acids, organic phosphatic acids, dimethylpolysiloxane 95.0% Constituents Ineffective as Spray Adjuvant 5.0%	14 or More 2.5 lb. Jugs	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer Turf Fuel- HALO 90 Part # i506946	\$ 48.45	<R> Balance pH #D2482, 2.5 gallon jug	\$ 70.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Lesco, #400507, Lesco Spreader Sticker, 2.5 gal	\$ 39.25	Manufacturer WINFIELD Part # 1400362	\$ 45.40
7	Aloft LC SC Insecticide or equal Active Ingredients: Clothianidin 24.7% Bifenthrin 12.3% Other Ingredients: 63%	10 or More 64 oz. Bottles	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer NUFARM Part # i505091	\$ 569.30	Aloft LC SC #A5060 - AGENCY Price	\$ 569.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Nufarm Part # 1006054	\$ 569.30	Manufacturer Nufarm Part # NUF10670464	\$ 569.30	Valent, #10677464	\$ 569.30	Manufacturer NUFARM Part # 1631641	\$ 569.30
8	DuPont Advion Insect Granule or equal: Active Ingredients: Indxcarb (Oxadiazine Chemical class) 0.22% Other ingredients: 99.78%	120 or More 25 lb. Bags	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer SYNGENTA Part # i502749	\$ 66.35	Advion Insect G #Y0025	\$ 78.75	Manufacturer: Syngenta Part # 808464	\$ 66.75	Manufacturer Syngenta Part # Advion4	\$ 66.46	Syngenta	\$ 57.50	Manufacturer Syngenta Part # 1002919	\$ 58.18	Manufacturer Syngenta Part # PC53202	\$ 64.00	Syngenta, #53202	\$ 68.00	Manufacturer SYNGENTA Part # 1514148	\$ 58.87
9	IMAGE 70 DG Herbicide or equal: Active Ingredients: Imazaquin 70.0% Other Ingredients: 30%	10 or More 11.43 oz. Bottles	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer AMVAC Part # i505562	\$ 119.19	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: AMVAC. SCEPTER 70WDG 11.43OZ BT 10/CS 13997 Part # 834793	\$ 117.09	Manufacturer Amvac Part # Scepter	\$ 123.13	Helena		Manufacturer: Sceptor T&O by Amvac Part # 1006836	\$ 124.20	No Bid	No Bid	Amvac #13997, Sceptor 70WDGT+O, 11-43 oz	\$ 120.00	No Bid	No Bid

<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB # 21-064-B-JE</b> Herbicides, Pesticides, and Fertilizers <b>August 25, 2020 at 2:00 PM</b> Opened By: Janice Ellis Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval October 6, 2020</b>  <b>Date Solicited: July 30, 2020</b> <b>Date Opened: August 25, 2020</b> <b># Solicited 424 # MWBE 56</b> <b># Planholders 25 # Submittals 11</b>		Alligare, LLC 1565 5th Avenue, Opelika, AL 36801 Norma Cassinari 772-473-7333 ngcassinari@alligare.com		Target Specialty Products 7380 Phillips Hwy Suite 303, Jax., FL 32256 Chad Martin, Territory Manager 904-728-8736 chad.martin@target-specialty.com		Diamond R. Fertilizer Co., Inc. 4100 Glades Cutoff Road, Fort Pierce, FL 34981 Thom Chester 772-201-0099 thomchester@comcast.net		ES OPCO USA LLC 7501 Municipal Drive Orlando, FL 328196 Mark Schneiderwind, Customer Service Manager 407-843-2611 mark.schneiderwind@veseris.com		Harrell's, LLC P.O. Box 807, Lakeland, FL 33802 Dave Nowakowski 786-390-9154 dnowakowski@Harrells.com		Helena Chemical Company P.O. Box 1758, Dade City, FL 33526 Mike Giddens, Sales Representative 352-567-5622 giddensc@helenaagri.com		Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Co., Inc 8306 South Orange Ave., Orlando, FL 32809 Todd Ronske 352-427-5596 Tronske@Howardfert.com		MAR Green Resources LLC P.O. Box 563, Loxahatchee, FL 33470 Kriss Ramroop 561-791-6298 sales@magreenresources.com		SiteOne Landscape Supply 1385 East 36th Street, Cleveland, Ohio 44114 Keith McGinty, Director 216-706-9250 ext. 2 bids@siteone.com		Winfield Solutions, LLC 2601 W. Orange Blossom Trail, Apopka, FL 32712 Ken Gagne, Territory Manager-Central Florida 407-256-6710 kwgagne@landlakes.com		PowerX
10	Agrisolutions Level 7 Spreader, Water Conditioning Agent, and Acidifier or equal: Principal Functioning Agents: Saccharides, ammonium sulfate, tricarboxylic acid 51.55% Constituents Ineffective as Spray Adjuvant 48.45%	14 or More 2.5 Gallon Jugs	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer TURF FUEL-THE WORKS Part # <u>1506957</u>	\$ 78.25	Absorb AMS Plus #D2306, 2.5 gallon jug.	\$ 38.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Induce p/n: Helena, 2.5 gallon jugs	\$ 52.50	Manufacturer: New Balance by Precision Lab Part # 1004559	\$ 40.01	No Bid	No Bid	Exacto, #ExA-02023-04, yardage 2-5 gal	\$ 46.00	Manufacturer WINFIELD Part # 1433165	\$ 45.00
11	MSO Concentrate with LECl-TECH (Modified Seed Oil, Modified Vegetable Oil and Surfactant Blen or equal: Prinicipal Functioning Agents: Methylated Vegetable oil, alcohol ethoxylate, phosphatidylcholine 100%	14 or More 2.5 Gallon Jugs	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer TURF FUEL-CONIC Part # <u>1506947</u>	\$ 62.50	<R> MSO #D3105, 2.5 gallon jug	\$ 52.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 40.00	Manufacturer: Microyl by Precision Lab Part # 1004475	\$ 101.65	No Bid	No Bid	Lesco, #400512, Lesco MSO 2-5 gal	\$ 36.00	Manufacturer WINFIELD Part # 1422164	\$ 46.88
12	ProForm Q4 Plus Turf Herbicide or equal Active ingredients Quinclorac 8.43% Sulfentrazone 0.69% 2,4-d, Dimethylamine Salt 11.81% Dicamba, Dimethylamine Salt 1.49% Inert Ingredients: 77.58%	42 or More 2.5 Gallon Jugs	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer PBI GORDON Part # 1502113	\$ 277.10	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: PBI Gordon Part # 804524	\$ 291.76	No Bid	No Bid	Q4-plus, Helena, 2.5 gallon Jug	\$ 105.76	Manufacturer: PBI Gordon Part # 1004960	\$ 275.57	Manufacturer PBI Gordon Part # GD6971126R	\$ 260.00	Gordon's Perform #6971127	\$ 280.00	Manufacturer PBI GORDON Part # 10128083	\$ 274.25
13	SENCOR 75% Turf Herbicide or equal Active Ingredients Metribuzin, 4-Amino-6-(1,1-dimethylethyl)-3-(methylthio)-1,2,4-triazin-5(4H)-one 75% INERT INGREDIENTS:	19 or More 5 lb. Bottles	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer UPL-METRICOR Part # <u>1504909 5-lb container \$240.44</u> <u>-10lb - can only provide 10-lb container</u>	\$ 120.22	UPL_TriCor 75 DF #T7910, 5 lb jug	\$ 106.00	Manufacturer: Bayer Environmental Science Part # 427400, 5-lb container	\$ 445.75	Manufacturer: Bayer Part # 429.00	\$ 429.00	Metribuzin 75DF, 5 lb container	\$ 500.00	Manufacturer: Bayer Part # 1005185	\$ 413.44	Manufacturer UPL Part # CH9718180, Tricor 10lb bag price per 10lb is \$180- available only in 10-lb	\$ 90.00	Bayer, #427709	\$ 420.00	Manufacturer BAYER Part # 10116280	\$ 406.60
14	Tribute or equal Active Ingredients Thiencarbazone-methyl 9.9% Foramsulfuron-methyl 19.8% Halosulfuron-methyl 30.7% Other Ingredients: 39.5%	69 or More 6 oz. Bottles	no bid	no bid	\$240.44	\$ 360.00	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Bayer Environmental Science Part # 811032	\$ 360.00	Manufacturer: Bayer Part # 360.00	\$ 360.00		\$ 360.00	Manufacturer: Bayer Part # 1005689	\$ 360.00	Manufacturer Bayer Part # BYT81746257	\$ 360.00	Bayer, #81746257, Agency item - pricing is set by the mfg. and can change yearly.	\$ 360.00	Manufacturer BAYER Part # 1495276	\$ 360.00

<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB # 21-064-B-JE</b> Herbicides, Pesticides, and Fertilizers <b>August 25, 2020 at 2:00 PM</b> Opened By: Janice Ellis Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval October 6, 2020</b>  <b>Date Solicited: July 30, 2020</b> <b>Date Opened: August 25, 2020</b> <b># Solicited 424 # MWBE 56</b> <b># Planholders 25 # Submittals 11</b>		Alligare, LLC 1565 5th Avenue, Opelika, AL 36801 Norma Cassinari 772-473-7333 nrcassinari@alligare.com		Target Specialty Products 7380 Phillips Hwy Suite 303, Jax., FL 32256 Chad Martin, Territory Manager 904-728-8736 chad.martin@target-specialty.com		Diamond R. Fertilizer Co., Inc. 4100 Glades Cutoff Road, Fort Pierce, FL 34981 Thom Chester 772-201-0099 thomchester@comcast.net		ES OPCO USA LLC 7501 Municipal Drive Orlando, FL 328196 Mark Schneiderwind, Customer Service Manager 407-843-2611 mark.schneiderwind@veseris.com		Harrell's, LLC P.O. Box 807, Lakeland, FL 33802 Dave Nowakowski 786-390-9154 dnowakowski@Harrells.com		Helena Chemical Company P.O. Box 1758, Dade City, FL 33526 Mike Giddens, Sales Representative 352-567-5622 giddensc@helenaagri.com		Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Co., Inc 8306 South Orange Ave., Orlando, FL 32809 Todd Ronske 352-427-5596 Tronske@Howardfert.com		MAR Green Resources LLC P.O. Box 563, Loxahatchee, FL 33470 Kriss Ramroop 561-791-6298 sales@margreenresources.com		SiteOne Landscape Supply 1385 East 36th Street, Cleveland, Ohio 44114 Keith McGinty, Director 216-706-9250 ext. 2 bids@siteone.com		Winfield Solutions, LLC 2601 W. Orange Blossom Trail, Apopka, FL 32712 Ken Gagne, Territory Manager-Central Florida 407-256-6710 kwgagne@landlakes.com		PowerX
15	Top Choice Insecticide only: Fipronil: 5-amino-1(2,6-dichloro-4-(trifluoromethyl)-4-1((1,r,S)-(trifluoromethyl)sulfinyl)-1H-pyrazole-3-carbonitrile 0.0143% Insert Ingredients: 99.9857%	276 or More 50 lb. Bags	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BAYER Part # 1502080	\$ 139.00	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Bayer Environmental Science Part # 789590. This Agency product follows a quantity break pricing structure. 1-19 bags \$139.00/bag. 20+ 126.50/bag.	\$ 126.50	Manufacturer Bayer Part # 1005630	\$ 80.00	Manufacturer Bayer Part # BYT7998284 4R	\$ 139.00	Bayer, #79982844, Purchase less than 20 bags per order, price will be \$139./bg, Agency item - pricing is set by the mfg. and can change yearly.	\$ 126.50	Manufacturer BAYER Part # 10127961	\$ 126.50				
16	Termidor Termite Insecticide or equal: Active Ingredients: Fipronil: 5-amino-1-(2,6-dichloro-4-(trifluoromethyl)phenyl)-4-((1,R,S)-(trifluoromethyl)sulfinyl)-1-H-pyrazole-3-carbonitrile: 9.1% Inert Ingredients: 90.9%	15 or More Cases (78 oz. Bottles)	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer CONTROL SOLUTIONS-TAURUS SC Part # 1503436	\$ 95.00	Control Solutions Taurus SC #Y8581 (four 78 oz bottles per case, \$118.90 each)	\$ 475.60	Manufacturer: BASF Part # 798419	\$ 646.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 223.61	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer CSI Part # MT3599B, Taurus SC	\$ 120.00	BASF, #59021468	\$ 137.50	Manufacturer CONTROL SOLUTIONS Part # 1404954	\$ 105.00	
17	Gentrol Point Source or equal: Active ingredients: (S)-Hydroprene (CAS #65733-18-8): 90.6% OTHER INGREDIENTS:9.4%	60 or More Boxes 1 Box with 20 Point Source Stations	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer ZOECON Part # 501432	\$ 29.43	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Central Life Sciences Part # 641859	\$ 27.71	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer ZOECON Part # PC37890A	\$ 28.99	no bid	Manufacturer Part #	No Bid		
18	Snake Scram Granular Repellant or equal:	20 or More 8 lb. Pails	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer SNAKE OUT- Part # 1512830 (\$89.57/25#)	\$ 28.66	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: EPIC Repellents Part # 795970	\$ 40.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Epic Repellents Part # LFP5608	\$ 38.00	Enviro, #5608	\$ 38.00	No Bid	No Bid	
19	Tracker Dye or equal:	25 or More Cases (2.5 Gallon Containers)	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer TURF FUEL - PACIFIC BLUE Part # 1504885	\$ 34.13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Harrell's Part # HSMBSI, 2.5 gallon	\$ 61.21	Spec spray indicator, 1-gallon container	\$ 28.00	Manufacturer Turf Mark Blue by BASF Part # 1005610, 2.5 gallon container	\$ 101.65	No Bid	No Bid	Lesco, #008820, Llesco Tracker Dye Blue, 2-5 gal	\$ 84.00	Manufacturer WINFIELD Part # 1409198, 2.5 gallon container	\$ 121.15
20	DELTADUST® Insecticide or equal: Active Ingredients: Deltamethrin: 0.05% OTHER INGREDIENTS: 99.95%	20 or More Cases (1 lb. Container)	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BAYER Part # 1500631, 1-lb	\$ 15.01	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Bayer Environmental Science Part # 642215, case /24, 1-lb \$14.55	\$ 349.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.20	Manufacturer Part #	No Bid	Manufacturer Bayer Part # pc4191071	\$ 15.00	Bayer, #4191071, case/24- \$14.95 per 1-lb container	\$ 358.80	Manufacturer BAYER Part # 61963123/case/24, 1-lb/\$13.66	\$ 327.12	

<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB # 21-064-B-JE</b> Herbicides, Pesticides, and Fertilizers <b>August 25, 2020 at 2:00 PM</b> Opened By: Janice Ellis Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval October 6, 2020</b>  <b>Date Solicited: July 30, 2020</b> <b>Date Opened: August 25, 2020</b> <b># Solicited 424 # MWBE 56</b> <b># Planholders 25 # Submittals 11</b>		Alligare, LLC 1565 5th Avenue, Opelika, AL 36801 Norma Cassinari 772-473-7333 ngcassinari@alligare.com		Target Specialty Products 7380 Phillips Hwy Suite 303, Jax., FL 32256 Chad Martin, Territory Manager 904-728-8736 chad.martin@target-specialty.com		Diamond R. Fertilizer Co., Inc. 4100 Glades Cutoff Road, Fort Pierce, FL 34981 Thom Chester 772-201-0099 thomchester@comcast.net		ES OPCO USA LLC 7501 Municipal Drive Orlando, FL 328196 Mark Schneiderwind, Customer Service Manager 407-843-2611 mark.schneiderwind@veseris.com		Harrell's, LLC P.O. Box 807, Lakeland, FL 33802 Dave Nowakowski 786-390-9154 dnowakowski@Harrells.com		Helena Chemical Company P.O. Box 1758, Dade City, FL 33526 Mike Giddens, Sales Representative 352-567-5622 giddensc@helenaagri.com		Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Co., Inc 8306 South Orange Ave., Orlando, FL 32809 Todd Ronske 352-427-5596 Tronske@Howardfert.com		MAR Green Resources LLC P.O. Box 563, Loxahatchee, FL 33470 Kriss Ramroop 561-791-6298 sales@margreenresources.com		SiteOne Landscape Supply 1385 East 36th Street, Cleveland, Ohio 44114 Keith McGinty, Director 216-706-9250 ext. 2 bids@siteone.com		Winfield Solutions, LLC 2601 W. Orange Blossom Trail, Apopka, FL 32712 Ken Gagne, Territory Manager-Central Florida 407-256-6710 kwgagne@landlakes.com		PowerX
21	PHANTOM Termiticide-Insecticide or equal Active Ingredient: Chlorfenapyr: 4-bromo-2-(4-chlorophenyl)-1-(ethoxymethyl)-5-(trifluoromethyl)-1H-pyrrole-3-carbonitrile: 21.45% INERT INGREDIENTS: 78.55%	20 or more Cases (21 oz. Container)	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BASF Part # 1502243, 21-oz	\$ 110.22	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: BASF Part # 717229, case /20, \$69.23 per 21 oz.	\$ 276.89	No Bid	No Bid	\$68.76 ea.	\$ 275.06	Manufacturer Part #	No Bid	Manufacturer BASF Part # AM59021551	\$ 68.25	BASF, #01024 PARA, case/4, \$72.00 per - 21 oz	\$ 288.00	Manufacturer CONTROL SOLUTIONS Part # 1548289, \$66.95	\$ 267.80
22	CB-80 CONTACT Insecticide or equal Active Ingredient: Pyrethrins .0.50% *Piperonyl Butoxide, technical 4.00% INERT INGREDIENTS 95.50%	20 or more Cases (17 oz. Container)	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer FMC Part # 1501218	\$ 17.89	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: FMC Part # 814572	\$ 206.28	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.96	Manufacturer Part #	No Bid	Manufacturer fmc Part # PC10062912	\$ 18.50	FMC	\$ 216.00	Manufacturer FMC Part # 1417097 \$16.61/can	\$ 199.32	
23	DEMON WP(WETTABLE POWDER) Insecticide or equal Active Ingredient: Cypermethrin:1 (±)α-cyano-(3-phenoxyphenyl)methyl(±)-cis,trans-3-(2,2-dichloroethenyl)-2,2-dimethylcyclopropanecarboxylate * 40.0% Other Ingredients 60.0%	20 or more Cases (1 lb. Plastic Tub)	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer SYNGENTA Part # 1506120, box 12bags-4 pkgs 9.5 grams	\$ 79.09	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Syngenta Part # 656876 (Demon WP in a 1lb jar was discontinued only available in box of 4/12 packets) this is price for the individual box. 1 box is almost 1-pound. Box price.	\$ 78.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 803.37	Manufacturer Part #	No Bid	Manufacturer CSI Part # zzmt0305	\$ 49.00	Control Solutions, #82300305, Cyper WSP 1lb	\$ 312.00	Manufacturer SYNGENTA Part # 10134319	\$ 76.95	
24	CORNERSTONE Herbicide or equal: ACTIVE INGREDIENT: *Glyphosate, N-(phosphonomethyl) glycine, in the form of its isopropylamine salt 41.0% OTHER INGREDIENTS: 59.0%	20 or more Cases (2.5 Gallon Containers)	Alligare p/n: 13240 Glyphosate 4 plus	\$ 34.25	Manufacturer MONSANTO-RANGER PRO Part # 1502223	\$ 33.49	GlyStar Plus #G1022	\$ 70.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31.20	Manufacturer: Ranger Pro by Bayer Part # 1004984	\$ 32.61	Manufacturer Monsanto Part # msr99586, Ranger pro 2.5g	\$ 35.00	Lesco, #069289, Lesco Prosecutor Pro, 2-5 gal	\$ 75.00	Manufacturer WINFIELD Part # 10109579	\$ 57.15	

<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB # 21-064-B-JE</b> Herbicides, Pesticides, and Fertilizers <b>August 25, 2020 at 2:00 PM</b> Opened By: Janice Ellis Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval October 6, 2020</b>  <b>Date Solicited: July 30, 2020</b>  <b>Date Opened: August 25, 2020</b>  <b># Solicited 424 # MWBE 56</b> <b># Planholders 25 # Submittals 11</b>		Alligare, LLC 1565 5th Avenue, Opelika, AL 36801 Norma Cassinari 772-473-7333 nrcassinari@alligare.com		Target Specialty Products 7380 Phillips Hwy Suite 303, Jax., FL 32256 Chad Martin, Territory Manager 904-728-8736 chad.martin@target-specialty.com		Diamond R. Fertilizer Co., Inc. 4100 Glades Cutoff Road, Fort Pierce, FL 34981 Thom Chester 772-201-0099 thomchester@comcast.net		ES OPCO USA LLC 7501 Municipal Drive Orlando, FL 328196 Mark Schneiderwind, Customer Service Manager 407-843-2611 mark.schneiderwind@veseris.com		Harrell's, LLC P.O. Box 807, Lakeland, FL 33802 Dave Nowakowski 786-390-9154 dnowakowski@Harrells.com		Helena Chemical Company P.O. Box 1758, Dade City, FL 33526 Mike Giddens, Sales Representative 352-567-5622 giddensc@helenaagri.com		Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Co., Inc 8306 South Orange Ave., Orlando, FL 32809 Todd Ronske 352-427-5596 Tronske@Howardfert.com		MAR Green Resources LLC P.O. Box 563, Loxahatchee, FL 33470 Kriss Ramroop 561-791-6298 sales@magreenresources.com		SiteOne Landscape Supply 1385 East 36th Street, Cleveland, Ohio 44114 Keith McGinty, Director 216-706-9250 ext. 2 bids@siteone.com		Winfield Solutions, LLC 2601 W. Orange Blossom Trail, Apopka, FL 32712 Ken Gagne, Territory Manager-Central Florida 407-256-6710 kwgagne@landlakes.com		PowerX
25	SURE GUARD Herbicide or equal: Active Ingredient By Wt. *Flumioxazin . 51% Other Ingredients 49%	20 or more Cases (5 lb. Jugs)	Alligare p/n: 13240 Flumigard WDG, 5 lb. jugs)	\$ 165.00	Manufacturer NUFARM Part # I501564 SUREGUARD 16oz	\$ 161.60	Sure Guard (64 oz Bottle) #Y8482	\$ 550.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Semera- Helena 5- lb container	\$ 186.05	Manufactur er: Sureguard SC by Nufarm Part # 1006128, Sure Guard WDG 5 lb is discontinu ed. We are quoting Sureguard SC 64 oz.	\$ 550.95	Manufacturer Nufarm Part # nuf10698464, 64 oz container	\$ 550.94	Nufarm, #10698464	\$ 2,203.80	Manufacture r Part #	No Bid
26	LESCO CrossCheck Plus Multi- Insecticide or equal: Insecticide or equal Active Ingredient: By Wt. Bifenthrin 7.9% Other Ingredients: 92.1%	20 or more Cases (76 oz. Containers)	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer CSI Part # i503427 BIFEN I/T \$43.56/1GAL/\$25 .86 is 76 oz price	\$ 25.86	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 19.13	Manufactur er: Avalon by Prokoz (FMC) Part # 1003077	\$ 45.00	Manufacturer Prokoz Part # ch10064853	\$ 42.00	Lesco, #10062151, Lesco crosscheck 96 oz.-only size available/ca se/4, \$31.00 per 96 oz.	\$ 124.00	Manufacture r FMC CORP Part # 10115914	\$ 160.92
27	PRAMITOL® 5PS PELLETTED Herbicide or equal: ACTIVE INGREDIENTS: % BY WT. Prometon: 2,4-bis (isopropylamino)-6-methoxy-s- triazine 5.00% Simazine: 2-chloro-4,6-bis (ethylamino)-s-triazine 0.76% Sodium chlorate (NaClO3) 39.80% Sodium metaborate* 40.00% INERT INGREDIENTS: 14.44%	20 or more Cases (25 lb. Containers)	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer CSI Part # I512561	\$ 75.40	Makhteshim Agan_Pra mitol 5PS #Y8581	\$ 89.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Pramitol, 25 lb container	\$ 20.40	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer CSI Part # chpram3rr	\$ 69.30	Malchtshin a Agan, #82100040	\$ 78.70	Manufacture r CONTROL SOLUTION S Part # 10001328	\$ 62.50
28	FMC TALSTAR ONE™ MULTI- INSECTICIDE (or equal) Insecticide – Liquid Active Ingredients: (7.9%) Bifenthrin 7.9%	25 or more Cases (1 Gallon Container)	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer FMCPart # I501249	\$ 53.37	Quali- Pro_Bifen I/T #Y1214, case price (4/case - gallon/\$52. 85)	\$ 211.40	Manufactur er: Univar Masterline Bmaxx Part # 824654, case price (4 gallons in case- \$47.79)	\$ 191.16	No Bid	No Bid	Talak, 1- gallon container	\$ 35.56	Manufactur er: Talstar Pro by FMC Part # 1005508, 1- gallon container	\$ 51.97	Manufacturer Prokoz Part # ch10064853, 1 gallon container	\$ 42.00	Lesco, #10062152, Lesco Crosscheck plus, 1-gal	\$ 167.00	Manufacture r FMC CORP Part # 10115914, case /4-gal, gallon price- \$40.23	\$ 160.92
29	FMC TALSTAR ONE™ MULTI- INSECTICIDE (or equal) Insecticide – Liquid Active Ingredients: (7.9%) Bifenthrin 7.9% 1 Pint Spray Bottles	26 or more 1 Pint Bottles	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer FMC Part # I501233	\$ 23.52	No Bid	No Bid	Manufactur er: Univar Masterline Bmaxx Part # 824651, 1- pint bottle	\$ 11.99	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 22.51	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer FMC Part # ch10056778	\$ 24.49	FMC, #10056778, Talstar P 1- pint	\$ 26.00	Manufacture r FMC CORP Part # 10115912	\$ 24.70

<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB # 21-064-B-JE</b> Herbicides, Pesticides, and Fertilizers <b>August 25, 2020 at 2:00 PM</b> Opened By: Janice Ellis Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval October 6, 2020</b>  <b>Date Solicited: July 30, 2020</b> <b>Date Opened: August 25, 2020</b> <b># Solicited 424 # MWBE 56</b> <b># Planholders 25 # Submittals 11</b>		Alligare, LLC 1565 5th Avenue, Opelika, AL 36801 Norma Cassinari 772-473-7333 ngcassinari@alligare.com		Target Specialty Products 7380 Phillips Hwy Suite 303, Jax., FL 32256 Chad Martin, Territory Manager 904-728-8736 chad.martin@target-specialty.com		Diamond R. Fertilizer Co., Inc. 4100 Glades Cutoff Road, Fort Pierce, FL 34981 Thom Chester 772-201-0099 thomchester@comcast.net		ES OPCO USA LLC 7501 Municipal Drive Orlando, FL 328196 Mark Schneiderwind, Customer Service Manager 407-843-2611 mark.schneiderwind@veseris.com		Harrell's, LLC P.O. Box 807, Lakeland, FL 33802 Dave Nowakowski 786-390-9154 dnowakowski@Harrells.com		Helena Chemical Company P.O. Box 1758, Dade City, FL 33526 Mike Giddens, Sales Representative 352-567-5622 giddensc@helenaagri.com		Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Co., Inc 8306 South Orange Ave., Orlando, FL 32809 Todd Ronske 352-427-5596 Tronske@Howardfert.com		MAR Green Resources LLC P.O. Box 563, Loxahatchee, FL 33470 Kris Ramroop 561-791-6298 sales@magreenresources.com		SiteOne Landscape Supply 1385 East 36th Street, Cleveland, Ohio 44114 Keith McGinty, Director 216-706-9250 ext. 2 bids@siteone.com		Winfield Solutions, LLC 2601 W. Orange Blossom Trail, Apopka, FL 32712 Ken Gagne, Territory Manager-Central Florida 407-256-6710 kwgagne@landlakes.com		PowerX
30	MAXFORCE® INSECT CONTROL® GRANULAR INSECT BAIT or equal Active Ingredient: Hydramethylnon [Tetrahydro-5,5-dimethyl-2(1H)-pyrimidinone, (3-(4-(trifluoromethyl)phenyl)-1-(2-(4-(trifluoromethyl)phenyl) ethenyl)-2-propenylidene)hydrazone]1.0% Other Ingredients: 99.0%	150 or more 10 lb. Bags	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BAYER Part # I500611	\$ 92.52	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Bayer Environmental Science, this product is no longer made with Hydromethyl non. This size is now Maxforce FC Fire Ant Bait Part # 774012	\$ 89.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 55.67	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Bayer Part # pc79649886, 4-lb jug	\$ 58.00	Bayer, #79540816	\$ 92.00	Manufacturer Part #	No Bid	
31	DuPont™ Advion® FIRE ANT BAIT or equal Active Ingredient: Indoxacarb (S)-methyl 7-chloro-2,5-dihydro-2-[[[(methoxycarbonyl)[4(trifluoromethoxy)phenyl]amino]-carbonyl]indeno[1,2-e][1,3,4]oxadiazine-4a-(3H)-carboxylate 0.045% Other ingredients 99.955%	150 or more 12 lb. Bags	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer SYNGENTA Part # I502741 ADVION 288.48/25#, 12 lb = \$138.47, only 25lb available	\$ 138.47	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Syngenta Part # 808465 (priced for 25lb bag, 12lb bag no longer exists)	\$ 287.27	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 261.25	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Syngenta Part # sy53209, 25 lb bag	\$ 273.00	Syngenta, Advion Fire Ant, 25 lb.-only size available	\$ 285.00	Manufacturer NEUNDORF Part # 1691842 <i>Does not meet specs.</i>	\$ 126.87	
32	WASP AND HORNET PLUS SPRAY INSECTICIDE or equal Insecticide – Spray Active Ingredients: % By Weight Carbon Dioxide <5 Permethrin <1 Tetramethrin (1cyclohexine – 1,2 – Dicarboximido – methyl 2,2 – dimethyl – 3-(2 – Methyl-propenyl) Cyclopropanecarboxylate<1 12 – 17.5 Oz. Cans Per Case	25 or More Cases (17.5 oz. Cans)	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BASF Part # I502314, 17.5 oz.	\$ 8.37	Wasp Freeze #Y9800, 17.5 oz, case/12, \$9.40	\$ 112.80	Manufacturer: BASF Part # 813966, case/12 can, 17.5 oz, \$8.14 per can	\$ 97.68	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.50	Manufacturer Wasp Freeze by BASF Part # 1005857	\$ 7.85	Manufacturer BASF Part # wh59013766	\$ 9.06	Lesco, #100076057, case/12, 14 oz,	\$ 70.20	Manufacturer PARAGON Part # 1577408	\$ 97.32	
33	LESCO and Prosecutor (or equal) Active ingredient: *Glyphosate, N-(phosphonomethyl)glycine, in the form of its isopropylamine salt 41.0% OTHER INGREDIENTS: 59.0%,	30 or more Cases (2.5 Gallon Containers)	Alligare p/n: 13240 Glyphosate 4 plus	\$ 34.25	Manufacturer MONSANTO-RANGER PRO Part # I502223	\$ 33.49	GlyStar Plus #G1022	\$ 70.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	? \$ 31.20	Manufacturer: Ranger Pro by Bayer Part # 1004984	\$ 32.61	Manufacturer Monsanto Part # msr99586	\$ 35.00	Lesco, #069289, Lesco Prosecutor Pro, 2-5 gal	\$ 75.00	Manufacturer WINFIELD Part # 10109579	\$ 57.15	
34	Garlon 4 (or equal) Active Ingredient: triclopyr: 3,5,6-trichloro-2-pyridinyloxyacetic acid, butoxyethyl ester 61.6% Inert Ingredients 38.4%,	20 or more Cases (2.5 Gallon Containers)	Alligare p/n: 25766 Triclopyr 4, 2.5 gallon	\$ 100.00	Manufacturer CORTEVA Part # I506971, 2.5 gallon	\$ 212.64	Garlon 4 Ultra, case/2.5 gal,	\$ 370.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 158.17	Manufacturer: Dow Part # 1003975	\$ 237.74	Manufacturer Corteva Part # Tiremedy2	\$ 180.00	Lesco #702305, Lesco triclopyr 4-Ester, 2.5 gallon, case/2, \$150.00	\$ 300.00	Manufacturer DOW Part # 10115554	\$ 338.95	



<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB # 21-064-B-JE</b> Herbicides, Pesticides, and Fertilizers <b>August 25, 2020 at 2:00 PM</b> Opened By: Janice Ellis Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval October 6, 2020</b>  <b>Date Solicited: July 30, 2020</b> <b>Date Opened: August 25, 2020</b> <b># Solicited 424 # MWBE 56</b> <b># Planholders 25 # Submittals 11</b>		Alligare, LLC 1565 5th Avenue, Opelika, AL 36801 Norma Cassinari 772-473-7333 nrcassinari@alligare.com		Target Specialty Products 7380 Phillips Hwy Suite 303, Jax., FL 32256 Chad Martin, Territory Manager 904-728-8736 chad.martin@target-specialty.com		Diamond R. Fertilizer Co., Inc. 4100 Glades Cutoff Road, Fort Pierce, FL 34981 Thom Chester 772-201-0099 thomchester@comcast.net		ES OPCO USA LLC 7501 Municipal Drive Orlando, FL 328196 Mark Schneiderwind, Customer Service Manager 407-843-2611 mark.schneiderwind@veseris.com		Harrell's, LLC P.O. Box 807, Lakeland, FL 33802 Dave Nowakowski 786-390-9154 dnowakowski@Harrells.com		Helena Chemical Company P.O. Box 1758, Dade City, FL 33526 Mike Giddens, Sales Representative 352-567-5622 giddensc@helenaagri.com		Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Co., Inc 8306 South Orange Ave., Orlando, FL 32809 Todd Ronske 352-427-5596 Tronske@Howardfert.com		MAR Green Resources LLC P.O. Box 563, Loxahatchee, FL 33470 Kriss Ramroop 561-791-6298 sales@magreenresources.com		SiteOne Landscape Supply 1385 East 36th Street, Cleveland, Ohio 44114 Keith McGinty, Director 216-706-9250 ext. 2 bids@siteone.com		Winfield Solutions, LLC 2601 W. Orange Blossom Trail, Apopka, FL 32712 Ken Gagne, Territory Manager-Central Florida 407-256-6710 kwgagne@landlakes.com		PowerX
35	Gourmet Ant Bait Gel® (or equal) Active Ingredient: Disodium octaborate tetrahydrate 6% Inert Ingredients 94%	20 or more Cases (1.5 oz. Tubes)	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer INNOVATIVE PC PRODUCTS Part # I506800, box of 6, 1.5 oz, \$4.62 ea	\$ 27.72	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Innovative Pest Products Part # 755721, case/8- boxes/6- tubes/per tube, 1.5 oz., \$4.61	\$ 221.51	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Innovative Part # pcgabg048, Sold by the box of 6 tubes- priced by the tube	\$ 4.90	Whitwire Micro, #02455, Advance 6388b gel, 3 0-gm (4- tube/pkg)---- \$35. per pk of 4	\$ 175.00	No Bid	No Bid	
36	Maxforce FC MAGNUM Roach Killer Bait Gel (or equal) Active Ingredient: Fipronil*: [5-Amino-1-(2, 6- dichloro-4-trifluoromethyl) phenyl]-4-(1, R, S)- (trifluoromethyl sulfanyl)-1H- pyrazole-3- carbonitrile] 0.05% OTHER INGREDIENTS: 09.95%	20 or more Cases (33 Gram Tube - 12 Tubes per Cases)	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BAYER Part # I500609	\$ 105.30	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacture r: Bayer Environment al Science Part # 758685	\$ 104.73	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.11	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Bayer Part # pc79432135, price per 33gm tube	\$ 8.92	Bayer, # 79432135	\$ 105.00	Manufacturer r BAYER Part # 10129558 \$8.05/tube	\$ 96.60	
37	Mikropak – A fully liquefiable (99.998%) crystalline micronutrient or equal Iron (Fe) - 7.50% Soluble Iron – 7.50% Magnesium (Mg) - 3.5% Soluble Magnesium – 3.90% Manganese (Mn) - 3.5% Soluble Manganese – 3.90% Zinc (Zn) - 1.8% Soluble Zinc – 2.00% Sulfur (S) - 3% Free Sulfur – 4.70%	65 or more 2.5 lb. per Containers	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer TG PRO 0-0-6 MICRO Part # I505289, 3-lb container, 3 lb per acre	\$ 7.60		MicroPlex Minors #M6205 (5lb containers, \$8.50/lb)	\$ 42.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Lesco, # 510877, Lesco Macron Micromix, 0- 0-0 7.6%Fe 25lb., 2.5 lb =\$6.50	\$ 65.00	Manufacture r WINFIELD Part # 167257, quoting 25lb pail, 2.5 lb is \$12.00	\$ 120.00	
38	GRAVITY™ L 12-0-12 – With Max-In Technology - Slow Release Nitrogen Liquid Fertilizer or equal Total Nitrogen (N)* 12.0% 9.0% Urea Nitrogen 3.0% Other Water Soluble Nitrogen Soluble Potash (K2O) 12.0% Iron (Fe) 0.5% 0.5% Chelated Iron (Fe) Manganese (Mn) 0.4% 0.4% Chelated Manganese (Mn)	349 or more 2.5 Gallon Jugs	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer TG PRO 12-0-0 NUTRISCAPE Part # I506933	\$ 17.64	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer MAR Green Part # MG120152.5	\$ 46.25	Lesco, #082971, Lesco Green Flo 12-0-12, 2-5 gal	\$ 26.50	Manufacture r WINFIELD Part # 1431548, 2.5 gallon jug	\$ 18.75	

<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB # 21-064-B-JE</b> Herbicides, Pesticides, and Fertilizers <b>August 25, 2020 at 2:00 PM</b> Opened By: Janice Ellis Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval October 6, 2020</b>  <b>Date Solicited: July 30, 2020</b> <b>Date Opened: August 25, 2020</b> <b># Solicited 424 # MWBE 56</b> <b># Planholders 25 # Submittals 11</b>		Alligare, LLC 1565 5th Avenue, Opelika, AL 36801 Norma Cassinari 772-473-7333 nrcassinari@alligare.com		Target Specialty Products 7380 Phillips Hwy Suite 303, Jax., FL 32256 Chad Martin, Territory Manager 904-728-8736 chad.martin@target-specialty.com		Diamond R. Fertilizer Co., Inc. 4100 Glades Cutoff Road, Fort Pierce, FL 34981 Thom Chester 772-201-0099 thomchester@comcast.net		ES OPCO USA LLC 7501 Municipal Drive Orlando, FL 328196 Mark Schneiderwind, Customer Service Manager 407-843-2611 mark.schneiderwind@veseris.com		Harrell's, LLC P.O. Box 807, Lakeland, FL 33802 Dave Nowakowski 786-390-9154 dnowakowski@Harrells.com		Helena Chemical Company P.O. Box 1758, Dade City, FL 33526 Mike Giddens, Sales Representative 352-567-5622 giddensc@helenaagri.com		Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Co., Inc 8306 South Orange Ave., Orlando, FL 32809 Todd Ronske 352-427-5596 Tronske@Howardfert.com		MAR Green Resources LLC P.O. Box 563, Loxahatchee, FL 33470 Kriss Ramroop 561-791-6298 sales@magreenresources.com		SiteOne Landscape Supply 1385 East 36th Street, Cleveland, Ohio 44114 Keith McGinty, Director 216-706-9250 ext. 2 bids@siteone.com		Winfield Solutions, LLC 2601 W. Orange Blossom Trail, Apopka, FL 32712 Ken Gagne, Territory Manager-Central Florida 407-256-6710 kwgagne@landlakes.com		PowerX
39	GRAVITY™ L 28-0-0 with Max-In® Technology - Slow Release Nitrogen Liquid Fertilizer or equal Total Nitrogen (N)* 28.0% 11.2% Urea Nitrogen 16.8% Other Water Soluble Nitrogen	349 or more 2.5 Gallon Jugs	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer TG PRO 25-0-0 Part # I512411	\$ 17.33	<R> 28-0-0 #X7302, 2.5 gallon jug	\$ 30.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer MAR Green Part # MG30002.5	\$ 35.00	Lesco, #098320, Lesco liquid 30-0-0, 60%CRN 2-5gal	\$ 23.00	Manufacturer WINFIELD Part # 1431549, 2.5 gallon jug	\$ 28.75	
40	SOS 211 Winter Bermuda grass Overseed or equal	169 or more 50 lb. Bags	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer COLUMBIA SEEDS Part # I505614	\$ 60.26	Diamond Special Rye Blend	\$ 57.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Barenbrug Part # fs9221	\$ 58.00	Lesco, #29-508-55, Allsport5 50lb	\$ 56.00	No Bid	No Bid	
41	Maxforce FC Ant Killer Bait Gel ACTIVE INGREDIENT: Fipronil*: .....0.001% OTHER INGREDIENTS:..99.999% .....Total:..100.000%	27g syringes	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BAYER Part # I500599 \$27.52/4 syringes	\$ 27.00	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Bayer Environmental Science Part # 834531 (Maxforce FC Ant has been discontinued and replaced with Maxforce Fleet. Priced for Maxforce Fleet)	\$ 28.30	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.61	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bayer, #85363883	\$ 28.75	Manufacturer BAYER Part # 1675645	\$ 26.37	
42	Advion Ant Bait Gel -Active Ingredient: Indoxacarb*: (S)-methyl 7-chloro-2,5-dihydro-2-[[[(methoxycarbonyl) [4(trifluoromethoxy) phenyl]amino] carbonyl]indeno[1,2-e] [1,3,4]oxadiazine-4a-(3H)carboxylate ..... 0.05% Other Ingredients 99.95% Total: 100.00%	30g syringes	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BAYER Part # I506108 \$26.31/4 syringes	\$ 26.31	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Syngenta Part # 843971	\$ 26.09	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 21.76	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Syngenta Part # pc52462, sold by the box of 4 tubes =\$34	\$ 34.00	Syngenta, #53204	\$ 27.00	Manufacturer SYNGENTA Part # 1682684	\$ 24.70	
43	Optigard Ant Bait Gel Active Ingredient: Thiamethoxam (CAS No. 153719-23-4) ..... 0.010% Other Ingredients: 99.990% Total: 100.000%	30g syringes	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer SYNGENTA Part # I506103 \$24.70/4 syringes	\$ 24.70	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Syngenta Part # 758362	\$ 24.49	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 30.64	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Syngenta Part # pc34318, Sold by the box of 4 tube=\$26	\$ 26.00	Syngenta, #34318	\$ 25.00	Manufacturer SYNGENTA Part # 1652575	\$ 25.48	

<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB # 21-064-B-JE</b> Herbicides, Pesticides, and Fertilizers <b>August 25, 2020 at 2:00 PM</b> Opened By: Janice Ellis Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval October 6, 2020</b>  <b>Date Solicited: July 30, 2020</b> <b>Date Opened: August 25, 2020</b> <b># Solicited 424 # MWBE 56</b> <b># Planholders 25 # Submittals 11</b>		Alligare, LLC 1565 5th Avenue, Opelika, AL 36801 Norma Cassinari 772-473-7333 nrcassinari@alligare.com		Target Specialty Products 7380 Phillips Hwy Suite 303, Jax., FL 32256 Chad Martin, Territory Manager 904-728-8736 chad.martin@target-specialty.com		Diamond R. Fertilizer Co., Inc. 4100 Glades Cutoff Road, Fort Pierce, FL 34981 Thom Chester 772-201-0099 thomchester@comcast.net		ES OPCO USA LLC 7501 Municipal Drive Orlando, FL 328196 Mark Schneiderwind, Customer Service Manager 407-843-2611 mark.schneiderwind@veseris.com		Harrell's, LLC P.O. Box 807, Lakeland, FL 33802 Dave Nowakowski 786-390-9154 dnowakowski@Harrells.com		Helena Chemical Company P.O. Box 1758, Dade City, FL 33526 Mike Giddens, Sales Representative 352-567-5622 giddensc@helenaagri.com		Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Co., Inc 8306 South Orange Ave., Orlando, FL 32809 Todd Ronske 352-427-5596 Tronske@Howardfert.com		MAR Green Resources LLC P.O. Box 563, Loxahatchee, FL 33470 Kriss Ramroop 561-791-6298 sales@margreenresources.com		SiteOne Landscape Supply 1385 East 36th Street, Cleveland, Ohio 44114 Keith McGinty, Director 216-706-9250 ext. 2 bids@siteone.com		Winfield Solutions, LLC 2601 W. Orange Blossom Trail, Apopka, FL 32712 Ken Gagne, Territory Manager-Central Florida 407-256-6710 kwgagne@landlakes.com		PowerX
44	Siesta Fire Ant Bait Active Ingredient: Metaflumizone* (CAS No 139968-49-3).....0.063% Other Ingredients:.....99.937 % Total.....100.00%	25lb Bag	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BASF Part # i502326	\$ 270.02	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacture r: BASF Part # 810944	\$ 259.54	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 292.50	Manufactur er: BASF Part # 1005210, We do not have 25lb bags so we are quoting the 15lb bags	\$ 187.83	Manufacturer BASF Part # AM59013791	\$ 260.00	BASF, #59011057	\$ 198.00	No Bid	No Bid	
45	Advion Optigard Cockroach Gel Bait (30g syringes) Active Ingredient: Emamectin benzoate (CAS No. 155569-91-8) . . . . . 0.1% Other Ingredients: 99.9% Total: 100.0%	30g syringes	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer SYNGENTA Part # I506569	\$22.70/4	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacture r: Syngenta Part # 833666	\$ 22.70	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19.66	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Syngenta Part # pc61597, Sold by the box of 4 tubes=\$22.04	\$ 22.04	Syngenta, #615973	\$ 22.70	No Bid	No Bid	
46	Advion Evolution Cockroach Gel Bait-Active Ingredient: Indoxacarb: (S)-methyl 7-chloro-2,5-dihydro-2- [[methoxycarbonyl] [4(trifluoromethoxy)phenyl]amino] carbonyl]indeno[1,2-e] [1,3,4]oxadiazine-4a- (3H)carboxylate . . . . . . 0.6% Other Ingredients 99.4% Total: 100.0%	30g syringes	no bid	no bid	Manufacurer SYGENTA Part # I506561	\$23.50/4	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacture r: Syngenta Part # 833664	\$ 23.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19.66	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Syngenta Part # sy61596,sold by the box of 4 tubes= \$22.40	\$ 22.40	Syngenta, #615963	\$ 23.25	Manufacture r SYNGENTA Part # 1686005		
47	Bell Labs Contrac All Weather - Active Ingredient: Bromadiolone (CAS #28772-56- 7).....0.005% Other Ingredients*.....99.995% *Contains Denatonium Benzoate Total.....100.000%	18lb pail	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BELL LABS Part # I504646	\$ 71.47	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacture r: Bell Labs Part # 820637	\$ 69.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 71.38	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Bell labs Part # pccb4051	\$ 68.54	Bell Labs, #CB4051	\$ 71.00	Manufacture r BELL LAB Part # 10123700	\$ 73.74	
48	Provoke Gel for Rat Traps - Non Hazardous Ingredients (Proprietary)	8 oz, bottle	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BELL LAB Part # I504758	\$ 12.56	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacture r: Bell Labs Part # 773989	\$ 13.49	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Bell labs Part # pcr8098	\$ 13.50	Bell Labs, #PR8098	\$ 13.25	No Bid	No Bid	
49	Protecta EVO Express Bait Station		no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BELL LABS Part # I504081	\$ 13.29	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacture r: Bell Labs Part # 800150	\$ 14.15	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 25.95	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Bell labs Part #	\$ 13.50	Protecta EVO, #IQ9307	\$ 15.00	Manufacture r BELL LAB Part #1403343	\$ 13.71	
50	Trapper T-rex		no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BELL LAB Part # I503394	\$ 4.31	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacture r: Bell Labs Part # 720177	\$ 4.41	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Bell labs Part # pcst2000, sold by the case of 12( priced per case)	\$ 4.25	trapper T- Rex, ST2000	\$ 4.50	Manufacture r BELL LAB Part #10129587	\$ 4.45	

<b>TABSHEET</b> <b>ITB # 21-064-B-JE</b> Herbicides, Pesticides, and Fertilizers <b>August 25, 2020 at 2:00 PM</b> Opened By: Janice Ellis Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells <b>This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval October 6, 2020</b>  <b>Date Solicited: July 30, 2020</b> <b>Date Opened: August 25, 2020</b> <b># Solicited 424 # MWBE 56</b> <b># Planholders 25 # Submittals 11</b>		Alligare, LLC 1565 5th Avenue, Opelika, AL 36801 Norma Cassinari 772-473-7333 ngcassinari@alligare.com		Target Specialty Products 7380 Phillips Hwy Suite 303, Jax., FL 32256 Chad Martin, Territory Manager 904-728-8736 chad.martin@target-specialty.com		Diamond R. Fertilizer Co., Inc. 4100 Glades Cutoff Road, Fort Pierce, FL 34981 Thom Chester 772-201-0099 thomchester@comcast.net		ES OPCO USA LLC 7501 Municipal Drive Orlando, FL 328196 Mark Schneiderwind, Customer Service Manager 407-843-2611 mark.schneiderwind@veseris.com		Harrell's, LLC P.O. Box 807, Lakeland, FL 33802 Dave Nowakowski 786-390-9154 dnowakowski@Harrells.com		Helena Chemical Company P.O. Box 1758, Dade City, FL 33526 Mike Giddens, Sales Representative 352-567-5622 giddensc@helenaagri.com		Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Co., Inc 8306 South Orange Ave., Orlando, FL 32809 Todd Ronske 352-427-5596 Tronske@Howardfert.com		MAR Green Resources LLC P.O. Box 563, Loxahatchee, FL 33470 Kriss Ramroop 561-791-6298 sales@margreenresources.com		SiteOne Landscape Supply 1385 East 36th Street, Cleveland, Ohio 44114 Keith McGinty, Director 216-706-9250 ext. 2 bids@siteone.com		Winfield Solutions, LLC 2601 W. Orange Blossom Trail, Apopka, FL 32712 Ken Gagne, Territory Manager-Central Florida 407-256-6710 kwgagne@landlakes.com		PowerX	
51	Trapper Mini-rex		no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BELL LAB Part # I503395, case of 24, \$1.11 each	\$ 26.58	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Bell Labs Part # 776692	\$ 1.13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Part #	trapper T-Rex, #ST2024	\$ 1.25	Manufacturer BELL LAB Part #10129588	\$ 1.14		
52	Trapper Glue Boards		no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BELL LABS Part # I504753, case/72, \$2.22 ea	\$ 16.04	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Bell Labs Part # 398790, box/48-, 2/pk, \$2.51 pk	\$ 60.17	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer Part #	Trapper Glue Boards, TM2817, PK/2	\$ 0.93	No Bid	No Bid		
53	Stryker 6-60 Multipurpose Insecticide Active Ingredients: Pyrethrins (CAS No. 8003-34-7) .....6% Piperonyl butoxide* (CAS No. 51-03-6) ..... 60% Other Ingredients ..... 34% Total .....100%	16 oz bottle	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer BELL LABS Part # I504753, wrong item quoted. Quoted the same item as line item 52	\$ 16.04	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Control Solutions Part # 810465, 16-oz	\$ 40.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 43.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer CSI Part # mt82100100	\$ 48.00	control Solutions, #82100100, 16-oz	\$ 37.95	No Bid	No Bid	
54	Tekko Pro Insect Growth Regulator Active Ingredients: 2-[1-Methyl-2-(4-phenoxyphenoxy) ethoxy] pyridine (Pyriproxyfen)..... 1.30% Novaluron* ..... 1.30% OTHER INGREDIENTS** ..... 97.40% Total 100.00%	16 oz bottle	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer CSI Part # I503435	\$ 31.21	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Control Solutions Part # 811120	\$ 34.48	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.19	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer CSI Part # mt82100005	\$ 34.00	control Solutions, #82100005, 16-oz	\$ 34.00	Manufacturer CONTROL SOLUTION S Part # 1554905	\$ 34.81	
55	Victor Roach Pheromone Trap M3	48 units/case	no bid	no bid	Manufacturer VICTOR Part # I503575	\$ 31.02	No Bid	No Bid	Manufacturer: Woodstream Part # 641837	\$ 32.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	16 oz	no bid	No Bid	No Bid		