

SCHOOL BOARD OF BREVARD COUNTY, FLORIDA

BOARD AGENDA ITEM – August 10, 2021

PROCUREMENT SOLICITATION

ITB 21-572-B-WH - Temporary Personnel Services

<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> (ITB) Invitation To Bid	<input type="checkbox"/> (ITN) Invitation To Negotiate	<input type="checkbox"/> (PB) Piggyback
<input type="checkbox"/> (RFP) Request For Proposal	<input type="checkbox"/> (RFQ) Request For Qualifications	<input type="checkbox"/> (SC) State Contract
<input type="checkbox"/> (SS) Sole Source		

REQUESTOR: Food and Nutrition Services

Legal Review Required: Yes No

Standard Template Used with No Changes: Yes No

Standard Template: ITB

VENDOR NAME	AMOUNT AWARDED	REQUIRED PRODUCTS/SERVICES
22 nd Technologies, Inc. Aue Staffing DATSON360 LLC Moten Tate, Incorporated Quality Labor Management, LLC and Associates RADgov, Inc. Spur Employment, Inc. StaffEZ of Florida	Variable	Temporary Personnel Services
Total	Variable	

<input type="checkbox"/> Contract Renewal	New Contract Amount	Variable
<input type="checkbox"/> Recurring Contract	Previous Contract Amount	Variable
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> New Contract	Variance	N/A

PRICE INCREASE / DECREASE EXPLANATION: N/A

DISCUSSION:

This contract is to provide temporary personnel services for use District-wide. The successful awardees shall provide temporary personnel services on an as-needed basis. The department utilizing the temporary personnel services will be responsible for providing necessary funding to cover the expense.

The standard Invitation to Bid template has been used, which does not require legal review.

CONTRACT TERM:

The initial contract term shall commence August 11, 2021 and continue until August 10, 2024 with an optional one (1) two (2) year renewal period.

RECOMMENDATION:

It is the recommendation of Robin Novelli, Chief Operating Officer, and Kevin Thornton, Director of Food and Nutrition Services to award the solicitation to the vendors listed above.

AUTHORITY FOR ACTION:

Florida Administrative Code 6A-1.012 (9)

School Board of Brevard County
Office of Procurement & Distribution Services
2700 Judge Fran Jamieson Way
Viera, FL 32940-6601
Mark W. Mullins, Ed.D., Superintendent



July 13, 2021

NOTICE OF INTENDED DECISION
Solicitation #21-572-B-WH
Temporary Personnel Services

The Office of Procurement Services hereby notifies all firms of an intended decision regarding the award of the above-mentioned solicitation as attached.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section [120.57](#)(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

Please contact Wil Henzmann, Senior Buyer at 321-633-1000 ext. 11623 or by email at henzmann.william@brevardschools.org if you should have any questions. Thank you for your continued interest in The School Board of Brevard County, Florida.

Sincerely,

Kristine Rodriguez, MBA, CPPO, CPPB
Director of Procurement and Distribution Services

TABSHEET ITB # 21-572-B-WH Temporary Personnell Services July 2, 2021 at 2:00 PM Opened By: Wil Henzmann, Senior Buyer Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells, Buyer This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval July 29, 2021 Date Solicited: June 11, 2020 Date Opened: July 2, 2020 464 Solicitated 23 MWBE 58 Planholders 10 Submittals		22nd Century Technologies, Inc. 8251 Greensboro Drive, Suite 900 McLean, Virginia 22102 Sandeep Singh 703-286-7655 sandeeps@tscti.com			AUE Staffing 777 E Altamonte Drive Altamonte Springs, Florida 32701 Elizabeth Torres 321-622-8306 Etorres@AUEStaffing.com			BuzzClan, LLC 5757 Alpha Rd., Suite 340 Dallas, Texas 75240 Schin Jain 469-251-2899 gov@buzzclan.com		
Completed Bidder's Acknowledgement	Yes			Yes			Yes			
FL Dept. of State Division of Corporations Number	Yes			Yes			No - In Process			
Litigations/Bankruptcy	No			Yes			No Response			
Confidential Materials Enclosed	No			Yes			No			
Addenda (if applicable)	Yes			Yes			Yes			
Pricing Sheet	Yes			Yes			Yes			
References Form	Yes			Yes			Yes			
Certified Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit (if applicable)	Yes			Yes			N/A			
Financials (if applicable)	Yes			Yes			No			
Bidder's Statement of Principal Place of Business (if applicable)	Yes			N/A			No			
Local Business Tax Receipts	No			Yes			No			
Current W-9	N/A			Yes			No			
Proof of Insurance	Yes			Yes			No			
Subcontractor Information (if applicable)	N/A			N/A			N/A			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	Hourly Employee Pay Rate	Markup Percent Maximum 36%	Hourly Bill Rate	Hourly Employee Pay Rate	Markup Percent Maximum 36%	Hourly Bill Rate	Hourly Employee Pay Rate	Markup Percent Maximum 36%	Hourly Bill Rate
1	Food Service Kitchen Worker	\$10.40	32.00%	\$13.73	\$10.40	36.00%	\$14.14	\$10.40	26.00%	\$13.10
2	Custodial Worker	\$10.84	32.00%	\$14.31	\$10.84	36.00%	\$14.74	\$10.84	26.00%	\$13.66
4	Group Leader for School Age Child Care	\$10.84	32.00%	\$14.31	\$10.84	36.00%	\$14.74	\$10.84	26.00%	\$13.66
5	Teache Assistant, Spacial Assistant	\$10.84	32.00%	\$14.31	\$10.84	36.00%	\$14.74	\$10.84	26.00%	\$13.66
6	Clerical Worker	\$11.31	32.00%	\$14.93	\$11.31	36.00%	\$15.38	\$11.31	26.00%	\$14.25
7	Warehouse Worker	\$11.46	32.00%	\$15.13	\$11.46	36.00%	\$15.59	\$11.46	26.00%	\$14.44
8	Mechanical Technician	\$11.31	32.00%	\$14.93	\$11.31	36.00%	\$15.38	\$11.31	26.00%	\$14.25
9	Mainteance Helper	\$11.31	32.00%	\$14.93	\$11.31	36.00%	\$15.38	\$11.31	26.00%	\$14.25
10	Clerk I	\$11.46	32.00%	\$15.13	\$11.46	36.00%	\$15.59	\$11.46	26.00%	\$14.44
11	Cook, Baker, Cashier	\$10.75	32.00%	\$14.19	\$10.75	36.00%	\$14.62	\$10.75	26.00%	\$13.55
12	Accounting Clerk	\$11.46	32.00%	\$15.13	\$11.46	36.00%	\$15.59	\$11.46	26.00%	\$14.44
13	Temporary Cafeteria Manger Intern	\$11.03	32.00%	\$14.56	\$11.03	36.00%	\$15.00	\$11.03	26.00%	\$13.90

Recommended Award Key: Columns highlighted in yellow identify the recommended award.

All other bidders did not meet the definition of responsive and responsible for this bid as outlined in Section 2.10

<p align="center">TABSHEET ITB # 21-572-B-WH Temporary Personnell Services July 2, 2021 at 2:00 PM Opened By: Wil Henzmann, Senior Buyer Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells, Buyer This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval July 29, 2021 Date Solicited: June 11, 2020 Date Opened: July 2, 2020 464 Solicitated 23 MWBE 58 Planholders 10 Submittals</p>	<p align="center">DATSON360 LLC 3800 Inverrary Blvd. Suite 101-N Lauderhill, Florida 33319 Rahul Kone 954-516-8851 rkone@datson360.com</p>	<p align="center">Diskriter, Inc. 2840 Library Road, Suite 300 Pittsburgh, Pennsylvania 15234 Laveena Yadav 412-465-1214 business.coordinator@diskriter.com</p>	<p align="center">MotenTate, Incorporated 301 East Pine Street, Suite 250 Orlando, Florida 32801 Kenneth Moten 407-843-3277 kmoten@motentate.com</p>
---	--	--	---

Completed Bidder's Acknowledgement	Yes	Yes	Yes
FL Dept. of State Division of Corporations Number	Yes	Yes	Yes
Litigations/Bankruptcy	No	No	No
Confidential Materials Enclosed	No	Yes	No
Addenda (if applicable)	Yes	Yes	Yes
Pricing Sheet	Yes	Yes	Yes
References Form	Yes	Yes	Yes
Certified Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit (if applicable)	N/A	N/A	Yes
Financials (if applicable)	No	Yes	Yes
Bidder's Statement of Principal Place of Business (if applicable)	N/A	N/A	N/A
Local Business Tax Receipts	Yes	Yes	Yes
Current W-9	No	Yes	Yes
Proof of Insurance	Yes	Yes	Yes
Subcontractor Information (if applicable)	N/A	N/A	N/A

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	Hourly Employee Pay Rate	Markup Percent Maximum 36%	Hourly Bill Rate	Hourly Employee Pay Rate	Markup Percent Maximum 36%	Hourly Bill Rate	Hourly Employee Pay Rate	Markup Percent Maximum 36%	Hourly Bill Rate
1	Food Service Kitchen Worker	\$10.40	30.00%	\$13.52	\$10.40	37.00%	\$14.25	\$10.40	35.00%	\$14.04
2	Custodial Worker	\$10.84	30.00%	\$14.09	\$10.84	37.00%	\$14.85	\$10.84	35.00%	\$14.63
4	Group Leader for School Age Child Care	\$10.84	30.00%	\$14.09	\$10.84	37.00%	\$14.85	\$10.84	35.00%	\$14.63
5	Teache Assistant, Spacial Assistant	\$10.84	30.00%	\$14.09	\$10.84	37.00%	\$14.85	\$10.84	35.00%	\$14.63
6	Clerical Worker	\$11.31	30.00%	\$14.70	\$11.31	37.00%	\$15.49	\$11.31	35.00%	\$15.27
7	Warehouse Worker	\$11.46	30.00%	\$14.90	\$11.46	37.00%	\$15.70	\$11.46	35.00%	\$15.47
8	Mechanical Technician	\$11.31	30.00%	\$14.70	\$11.31	37.00%	\$15.49	\$11.31	35.00%	\$15.27
9	Mainteance Helper	\$11.31	30.00%	\$14.70	\$11.31	37.00%	\$15.49	\$11.31	35.00%	\$15.27
10	Clerk I	\$11.46	30.00%	\$14.90	\$11.46	37.00%	\$15.70	\$11.46	35.00%	\$15.47
11	Cook, Baker, Cashier	\$10.75	30.00%	\$13.98	\$10.75	37.00%	\$14.73	\$10.75	35.00%	\$14.51
12	Accounting Clerk	\$11.46	30.00%	\$14.90	\$11.46	37.00%	\$15.70	\$11.46	35.00%	\$15.47
13	Temporary Cafeteria Manger Intern	\$11.03	30.00%	\$14.34	\$11.03	37.00%	\$15.11	\$11.03	35.00%	\$14.89

TABSHEET ITB # 21-572-B-WH Temporary Personnell Services July 2, 2021 at 2:00 PM Opened By: Wil Henzmann, Senior Buyer Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells, Buyer This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval July 29, 2021 Date Solicited: June 11, 2020 Date Opened: July 2, 2020 464 Solicitated 23 MWBE 58 Planholders 10 Submittals		Quality Labor Mangement, LLC and Affiliates 4035 W 1st Street Sanford, Florida 32771 Debbie Harris 321-305-5907 Dharris@myqlm.com			RADgov, Inc. 6750 N. Andrews Ave. Suite 200 Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33309 Pranay Mishra 954-938-2800 parhcer@radgov.com			Spur Employment, Inc. Post Office Box 107 Huntsville Alabama, 35804 Sonia Robinson 866-957-9142 sonia@spurstaffing.com		
Completed Bidder's Acknowledgement	Yes			Yes			Yes			
FL Dept. of State Division of Corporations Number	Yes			Yes			Yes			
Litigations/Bankruptcy	No			No			No			
Confidential Materials Enclosed	No			No			Yes			
Addenda (if applicable)	Yes			Yes			Yes			
Pricing Sheet	Yes			Yes			Yes			
References Form	Yes			Yes			Yes			
Certified Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit (if applicable)	N/A			Yes			N/A			
Financials (if applicable)	Yes			Yes			Yes			
Bidder's Statement of Principal Place of Business (if applicable)	N/A			N/A			Yes			
Local Business Tax Receipts	Yes			Yes			No			
Current W-9	Yes			Yes			Yes			
Proof of Insurance	Yes			Yes			Yes			
Subcontractor Information (if applicable)	N/A			N/A			N/A			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	Hourly Employee Pay Rate	Markup Percent Maximum 36%	Hourly Bill Rate	Hourly Employee Pay Rate	Markup Percent Maximum 36%	Hourly Bill Rate	Hourly Employee Pay Rate	Markup Percent Maximum 36%	Hourly Bill Rate
1	Food Service Kitchen Worker	\$10.40	36.00%	\$14.14	\$10.40	34.00%	\$13.94	\$10.40	26.00%	\$13.10
2	Custodial Worker	\$10.84	36.00%	\$14.74	\$10.84	34.00%	\$14.53	\$10.84	28.00%	\$13.88
4	Group Leader for School Age Child Care	\$10.84	34.00%	\$14.53	\$10.84	34.00%	\$14.53	\$10.84	22.00%	\$13.22
5	Teache Assistant, Spacial Assistant	\$10.84	34.00%	\$14.53	\$10.84	34.00%	\$14.53	\$10.84	22.00%	\$13.22
6	Clerical Worker	\$11.31	34.00%	\$15.16	\$11.31	34.00%	\$15.16	\$11.31	22.00%	\$13.80
7	Warehouse Worker	\$11.46	36.00%	\$15.59	\$11.46	34.00%	\$15.36	\$11.46	26.00%	\$14.44
8	Mechanical Technician	\$11.31	36.00%	\$15.38	\$11.31	34.00%	\$15.16	\$11.31	26.00%	\$14.25
9	Mainteance Helper	\$11.31	36.00%	\$15.38	\$11.31	34.00%	\$15.16	\$11.31	26.00%	\$14.25
10	Clerk I	\$11.46	34.00%	\$15.36	\$11.46	34.00%	\$15.36	\$11.46	22.00%	\$13.98
11	Cook, Baker, Cashier	\$10.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.75	34.00%	\$14.41	\$10.75	26.00%	\$13.55
12	Accounting Clerk	\$11.46	34.00%	\$15.36	\$11.46	34.00%	\$15.36	\$11.46	22.00%	\$13.98
13	Temporary Cafeteria Manger Intern	\$11.03	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.03	34.00%	\$14.78	\$11.03	26.00%	\$13.90

TABSHEET ITB # 21-572-B-WH Temporary Personnell Services July 2, 2021 at 2:00 PM Opened By: Wil Henzmann, Senior Buyer Witnessed By: Jennifer Wells, Buyer This is the tabsheet showing award recommendation pending Board Approval July 29, 2021 Date Solicited: June 11, 2020 Date Opened: July 2, 2020 464 Solicitated 23 MWBE 58 Planholders 10 Submittals	StaffEZ of Florida 109 E Crystal Lake Avenue, Suite 107 Lake Mary, Florida 32746 Evan Bledsoe 629-215-8973 hebledsoe@staffez.org
---	---

Completed Bidder's Acknowledgement	Yes
FL Dept. of State Division of Corporations Number	Yes
Litigations/Bankruptcy	No
Confidential Materials Enclosed	No
Addenda (if applicable)	No
Pricing Sheet	Yes
References Form	Yes
Certified Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit (if applicable)	N/A
Financials (if applicable)	Yes
Bidder's Statement of Principal Place of Business (if applicable)	N/A
Local Business Tax Receipts	Yes
Current W-9	No
Proof of Insurance	No
Subcontractor Information (if applicable)	N/A

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	Hourly Employee Pay Rate	Markup Percent Maximum 36%	Hourly Bill Rate
1	Food Service Kitchen Worker	\$10.40	29.45%	\$13.46
2	Custodial Worker	\$10.84	31.95%	\$14.30
4	Group Leader for School Age Child Care	\$10.84	26.95%	\$13.76
5	Teache Assistant, Spacial Assistant	\$10.84	26.95%	\$13.76
6	Clerical Worker	\$11.31	26.95%	\$14.36
7	Warehouse Worker	\$11.46	31.95%	\$15.12
8	Mechanical Technician	\$11.31	31.95%	\$14.92
9	Mainteance Helper	\$11.31	31.95%	\$14.92
10	Clerk I	\$11.46	26.95%	\$14.55
11	Cook, Baker, Cashier	\$10.75	26.95%	\$13.65
12	Accounting Clerk	\$11.46	26.95%	\$14.55
13	Temporary Cafeteria Manger Intern	\$11.03	29.45%	\$14.28